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Introduction
Character is revealed during crisis

—Helmut Schmidt

The current times reveal clear deficits in our understand-
ing of firms that face existential crises. These crises are 
technically referred to as turnaround situations in 
“established firms that once performed satisfactorily, 
specifically in terms of profitability, but no longer do” 
(Chen & Hambrick, 2012, p. 225; Pearce & Robbins, 
1993; Wenzel et  al., 2021). Even the most seasoned 
managers struggle to turn firms around successfully 
because the skills required—such as motivating disen-
franchised employees and doing more with a smaller 
headcount—differ from those needed in more buoyant 
conditions (Bibeault, 1982). Similarly, researching turn-
arounds is challenging because it raises a host of econo-
metric challenges, such as performance extremes, mean 
reversion, survivorship bias, and missing data, which 
may further explain why turnaround situations have 
been sparsely researched.

Driven by practical considerations, scholarly investi-
gations were initially shaped by the desire to find the 
appropriate countermeasure to turn a struggling firm 
around. Early research advised efficiency-oriented oper-
ational measures (e.g., Hambrick & Schecter, 1983), 
whereas later research emphasized the benefits of strate-
gic countermeasures (e.g., Barker & Duhaime, 1997). 
Modern turnaround research has revealed positive 
effects of their dual implementation (Schmitt & Raisch, 
2013). With mixed evidence on its general ramifica-
tions, turnaround literature has rarely focused on the 
antecedents of turnaround management such as 
governance conditions—one of these being the effect of 
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the founding family (i.e., of the founder or later-genera-
tion family members). In particular, how the founding 
“family affect[s] the outcome of the turnaround process” 
is largely unknown, especially regarding its perfor-
mance implications (Trahms et al., 2013 p. 1302).

In non-crisis settings, early research on the family 
firm–performance link, often driven by agency argu-
ments (Jensen & Meckling, 1976), has generally been 
divided, with some studies attributing a performance 
premium to family involvement (e.g., Anderson & Reeb, 
2003; Villalonga & Amit, 2006), while others argue the 
opposite (e.g., Bennedsen et  al., 2007; Hillier & 
McColgan, 2009). Scholars have reconciled these 
opposing views by arguing that, beyond agency, it is not 
simply a question of “whether” there is family involve-
ment in firm ownership and management. Rather, it is 
nowadays considered pivotal to assess “who” the execu-
tives and owners are (e.g., a founder versus a later-gen-
eration family member), and how their social context 
shapes their priorities (G. Petriglieri et  al., 2018; Van 
Knippenberg, 2011; Weick, 1995). To examine their 
divergent effects on firm trajectories, contemporary 
research distinguishes between (lone) founder and 
founding family involvement. Importantly, research 
argues that firm founders typically embrace entrepre-
neurial identities mirroring a social context of arms-
length relations with commercial stakeholders, while 
post-founder family owners or CEOs are typically 
affected by a context of family influence in the business, 
as well as abundant social capital, and assume familial 
identities. These identities can “blend” given an “in-
between” context of both founder and family involve-
ment (Cannella et al., 2015; Miller et al., 2011; Miller & 
Le Breton-Miller, 2011).

We build on extant work to assess the research ques-
tion, “How does founder or founding family involve-
ment affect turnaround performance?” We propose that 
founder and founding family involvement shapes crisis 
response and subsequent turnaround performance dif-
ferently, with outcomes that are distinct from a non-cri-
sis setting wherein founder involvement is regularly 
seen as a performance driver, whereas more “responsi-
ble” family involvement may lead to underperformance 
(Miller et al., 2007). We examine our hypotheses using a 
panel dataset of three decades of U.S. S&P 1,500 turn-
around firms, which we supplement with hand-collected 
data on the components of founder and founding family 
member involvement and turnaround responses. We 

find support for our arguments and discuss their impli-
cations for several strands of the literature. In particular, 
we observe that when several members of the founding 
family are involved without the founder, family firms 
are particularly well equipped to handle crises. Indeed, 
the components of involvement are found to be strong 
predictors of crises outcomes. For the family firm the-
ory, this suggests that fine-grained components can, to a 
large extent, overcome issues associated with capturing 
the intention to pursue a vision of trans-generational, 
sustainable family control (Chua et  al., 1999). As all 
firms eventually face crises that threaten their survival, 
our insights are relevant to entrepreneurs, entrepreneur-
ial families, executives, employees, and sometimes, 
even the (economic) wellbeing of entire communities.

Theory Development and 
Hypotheses

The influence of founders and their families on firms 
can be far-reaching and significant (Chua et al., 1999). 
The organizational ramifications of such influence are 
shaped by the divergent social contexts wherein the 
founders and founding family members govern, particu-
larly because of the impact of these contexts on their 
respective identities (Miller et al., 2011). Because iden-
tities drive individuals’ actions in administrative situa-
tions (Weick, 1995), a profound understanding of 
identities is imperative to apprehending the implications 
of founder and founding family involvement (Van 
Knippenberg, 2011).

Specifically, the leader identity construct is theoreti-
cally and empirically well established (e.g., Ibarra et al., 
2014; Petriglieri & Peshkam, 2022) and has three related 
elements: “individual internalization, relational recogni-
tion, and collective endorsement” (DeRue & Ashford, 
2010, p. 629). To elaborate, when people associate the 
meaning of leader with themselves, when others attri-
bute this meaning to them (Shamir & Eilam, 2005), and 
when the social context they are embedded in endorses 
their leadership claim (Brewer & Gardner, 1996), they 
can be said to possess a leader identity. Like all identi-
ties, a leader identity is neither a monolithic nor static 
construct; rather, its meanings, and who can lay claim to 
them, are shaped by and constructed through social and 
relational processes (DeRue & Ashford, 2010; Petriglieri 
et al., 2018). For instance, the meanings associated with 
being a leader in a military context may be socially 
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negotiated to include being tough in control and com-
mand (Thornborrow & Brown, 2009), whereas those 
associated with leadership in a health care context may 
be socially negotiated to include being caring, respon-
sive, and collaborative (Pratt et al., 2006). We build on 
these notions to outline how the social context shapes 
the identities assumed by founders and founding family 
members. From this, we derive hypotheses on their 
firms’ turnaround performance.

The Evolution of Social Context as Firms Age

The social context of firms that involve founders or 
founding family members is theoretically important 
because it evolves ontologically with firm age, from 
founding to maturity. It affects the meanings of the iden-
tities assumed by founders and founding family mem-
bers (Ekeh, 1974; Long, 2011; Miller et  al., 2011). 
Specifically, the social context of young firms with 
founder involvement, beyond the founder’s key stake-
holders (e.g., banks, investors, or early employees), is 
typically characterized by rudimentary ties based on 
instrumental exchange, whereas the social context of 
mature firms with continued founding family member 
involvement is characterized by evolved resilient ties 
with various organizational stakeholders that carry more 
trust and coherence than those in young firms (Miller & 
Le Breton-Miller, 2011).

Prior work suggests distinct identities for founders, 
who tend to adopt an entrepreneurial identity character-
ized by independence, self-efficacy, and risk-taking, and 
members of the founder’s family, who tend to adopt a 
familial identity characterized by interdependence, 
cohesion, and stability (Miller et al., 2011; Miller & Le 
Breton-Miller, 2011). In the following section, we 
describe the meanings associated with entrepreneurial, 
familial, and “professional” identities (the base case 
without founder and family involvement), along with 
the respective “local” social context that shapes them.

Founder Involvement and Entrepreneurial 
Leader Identities

Generally, people become entrepreneurs to build wealth 
independently by capitalizing on their business ideas. A 
successful founder’s identity is closely tied to their 
entrepreneurship and the firms they create (Cannella 
et  al., 2015; Dobrev & Barnett, 2005; Miller & Le 

Breton-Miller, 2011). In the United States, an entrepre-
neurial leader identity is highly valued and characterized 
by independence, self-efficacy, an internal locus of con-
trol, and a propensity to take risks (Shane, 2003). The 
social context of early-stage founder firms is rudimen-
tary and comprises investors, suppliers, or key employ-
ees who generally “prioritize economic interest” (Miller 
& Le Breton-Miller, 2011, p. 1057). Founders interact 
with these stakeholders in an entrepreneurial fashion 
with a focus on instrumentality, which aligns with the 
emerging social context of a young firm that is not yet 
strongly characterized by established relationships 
based on trust or coherence.

Family Involvement and Familial Leader 
Identities

As a firm matures, the interactions between the founder 
and stakeholders slowly become characterized by higher 
degrees of trust and coherence, as well as obligation and 
expectation (binding social ties; Coleman, 1990; Long, 
2011; Uzzi, 1997). Continuity in responsibility and 
long-term orientation allow them to nurture mutually 
supportive relationships with key actors in their social 
context and increase their social ties (Asch, 1952; Miller 
& Le Breton-Miller, 2005). This gives rise to solidarity 
and shared schemata among organizational stakeholders 
(Arregle et al., 2007; Carr et al., 2011).

When founder’s descendants inherit responsibility 
for the firm, they often do so within the local cosmos of 
this now evolved social context, which may involve 
multiple family members. At this stage, the firm may be 
the key source of income and security for the founder’s 
descendants, and a (shared) source of pride in what the 
family’s firm symbolizes and embodies in society 
(Ward, 2004). Founding family members are expected 
to uphold the firm culture and shared schemata and fol-
low a long-term orientation, not merely from the per-
spective of growth but also to provide continuity, 
reliability, and stability to the family and the firm’s 
stakeholders who make up the mature social context 
(Miller & Le Breton-Miller, 2005). In this context, the 
founding family members involved in the mature family 
firm, particularly when there are multiple, usually adopt 
a “familial identity” characterized by interdependence, 
cohesion, and stability—meanings that constitute an 
identity that is fundamentally intertwined with the firm 
and its history and culture (Miller et al., 2011).
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The Blending of Identities and the Baseline of 
Professional Leader Identities

We acknowledge that the identities portrayed earlier are, 
to an extent, the poles of a spectrum since joint founder 
and founding family member involvement can occur in 
the intermediate phases. Given that individuals can hold 
multiple identities (Stryker, 1980), both founder and 
founding family identities may “blend,” causing indi-
viduals to see themselves as “business builders and fam-
ily nurturers” and to follow the meanings of both 
identities (Miller et al., 2011, p. 8; Miller & Le Breton-
Miller, 2011).

Moreover, we include the case where both founder and 
founding family involvement are absent and, as a base-
line, representing a setting that is governed purely by 
“professional” executives. Professional leaders tend to 
aspire toward being characterized as confident, intelli-
gent, and self-aware individuals with integrity (Ibarra, 
1999) and strive to be affiliated with the social group of 
business leaders. Professional leaders’ potential career 
mobility implies that their identities are usually portable 
and less intertwined with the firms they lead (Petriglieri 
et al., 2018). They may draw their identities from being 
perceived as competent professionals (Baumeister, 1989), 
primarily guided by performance aspirations and share-
holder wealth (Cannella et  al., 2015; Cyert & March, 
1963; Sundaramurthy & Kreiner, 2008). This short-term 
orientation often renders their relationships they develop 
with stakeholders in the firm’s social context more trans-
actional rather than based on sustainable trust and loyalty 
(Gersick et al., 1997; Petriglieri & Petriglieri, 2010).

Identity Threats Triggered by Existential Firm 
Crises

Existential firm crises threaten the identities of founders 
and founding family members. They signal potential 
harm to the value of their identities and their ability to 
enact them (Petriglieri, 2011) because their identities are 
deeply intertwined with the fate of their firms. In the 
case of founders, the threatened firm is an extension of 
themselves (Dobrev & Barnett, 2005), and the positive 
value and self-worth they derive from being an entrepre-
neur is intimately tied to their venture as their creation. 
In the case of founder descendants, the threatened firm 
is an extension of their family (Calabrò et  al., 2018; 
Ward, 2004), and the positive value and self-worth they 
derive from being a custodian of the family heritage are 

intimately tied to the success of the firm. We classify the 
threat to the founders and founding family members’ 
identities as strong in existential firm crises because the 
“potential future harm to identity is great” (Petriglieri, 
2011, p. 649). If they are unable to turn their firms’ for-
tunes around, they could lose an important part of their 
identity. By contrast, the identities of professional lead-
ers are rarely this deeply intertwined with the fate of 
their employing organization. While a turnaround situa-
tion, if mishandled, is likely to harm the track record of 
professionals (Trahms et al., 2013), and hence the value 
of their identity, such situations do not normally threaten 
the entire basis of their identity, as they do for founders 
and founding family members.

When their identities are threatened, people are 
driven to act in ways that mitigate the threat. These 
threat responses are of two types—identity protection 
and identity restructuring (Petriglieri, 2011). When a 
person responds to a threat using identity-restructuring, 
they devalue or exit their threatened identity (Ashforth, 
2000; Crocker & Major, 1989). Conversely, when a per-
son responds to a threat using identity-protection, they 
act to eliminate the threat such that they can continue to 
claim and enact their valued identity. The identity-
restructuring response of devaluing or exiting their 
entrepreneurial or familial identities is particularly 
costly for founders and their descendants because this 
identity is central to their lives (Cast et al., 1999; Gecas, 
1982; Olson, 1968). Thus, we anticipate that they will 
respond to identity threats using the identity-protection 
response mechanism. Identity-protection responses rein-
force the virtues of the threatened identity by targeting 
the source of the threat (Petriglieri, 2011). 
Correspondingly, founders and family members are 
likely to exert influence toward achieving a firm turn-
around in ways that align with, rest on, and reinforce the 
logic and virtues of their (threatened) identities 
(Petriglieri & Devine, 2016). In the following section, 
we hypothesize how this coherence shapes a firm’s turn-
around performance in cases of founder and founding 
family involvement (Boyne & Meier, 2009; Pajunen, 
2006; Sundaramurthy & Kreiner, 2008). We summarize 
our hypotheses in Figure 1.

Turnaround Performance and Founder 
Involvement

We hypothesize that the way in which leaders respond to 
turnaround situations depends on the identities they hold 
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in relation to the firm, and that these differences impact 
turnaround performance. Specifically, how firm found-
ers pursue retrenchment and recovery responses to 
achieve turnaround (Schmitt & Raisch, 2013; Trahms 
et  al., 2013) should align with their entrepreneurial 
leader identity as risk-taking, opportunity-seeking, inde-
pendent operators (Gartner, 1988; Shane, 2003). We 
argue that this identity content should drive founders to 
favor particularly bold, independent, and far-reaching 
turnaround responses, without wide consultation with 
stakeholders, as they strive to set every wheel in motion 
to save their cherished creation from failure to reinforce 
their identity. While turnaround responses can indeed 
increase the chances of firm survival, they also incur 
costs such as compensation for dismissed employees or 
buying into new markets. The more turnaround 
responses a firm uses, the more the costs rise and the 
more likely it is that the firm experiences marginally 
decreasing profits of additional turnaround responses 

(Schmitt & Raisch, 2013). However, while corporate 
strategy would normally be adapted, and headcounts 
and assets retrenched only as much as necessary to 
enhance turnaround performance, founder involvement 
may risk derogating turnaround performance when 
founders try any means to save their treasured firm, thus 
advocating bold and costly degrees of change, rather 
than optimizing firm’s performance. Moreover, an iden-
tity-reinforcing response that relies on the entrepreneur-
ial hallmarks of being autonomous, free, and unbound in 
restructuring, including employee retrenchment, is 
likely to cause disappointment in relationships. 
Employees may implicitly expect limits to employee 
retrenchment because of their shared histories. 
Therefore, an unbound response can damage social cap-
ital, ultimately resulting in inferior performance (Adler 
& Kwon, 2002). Finally, given the founder’s involve-
ment in positions that may affect the strategic direction 
of the firm (Miller et  al., 2011), professionalization is 

Founder 
involvement

Founding 
family 

involvement

Firm 
performance

Context:
Severity

H2: +

H5: +

Context:
Firm age

H6: +

H3: -

H1: -

H4: +

Figure 1.  Model of Turnaround Performance and Founder and Founding Family Involvement.
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unlikely to fully prevent this response in an acute crisis 
accompanied by the need to reinforce entrepreneurial 
identity. Thus, we posit:

Hypothesis 1 (H1): Founder involvement will be 
negatively associated with subsequent turnaround 
performance.

Firms in crises differ in their degrees of performance 
severity (Barker & Duhaime, 1997; Chen & Hambrick, 
2012; Hofer, 1980). Although the bolder and wider-
reaching turnaround responses associated with founder 
involvement are likely to harm turnaround performance, 
we argue that they may be less inappropriate when a 
turnaround situation is particularly severe. While minor 
strategic adjustments are usually sufficient to resolve 
less-severe cases, if a turnaround situation is very severe, 
such as when the magnitude of company losses is high, 
major strategic reorientation, even at higher costs, is 
required (Chen & Hambrick, 2012; D’Aveni, 1989).

Indeed, when the turnaround situation is severe, 
internal and external stakeholders are more likely to be 
reassured by founders’ unwavering commitment to their 
firm, their image as capable coordinators of scarce 
resources (Alvarez & Busenitz, 2001), and their ten-
dency to convey a motivating and anchoring vision of 
the firm’s recovery (Bono & Ilies, 2006; Bono & Judge, 
2003). Stakeholder support can manifest as lower pre-
miums demanded to compensate for potential losses and 
shield the struggling firm from opportunistic takeover 
attempts; thus, reassuring stakeholders enhances perfor-
mance as severity intensifies (Arogyaswamy et  al., 
1995). We argue that founders’ bold turnaround 
responses eventually become adequate, but not superior, 
in extremely severe crises. Therefore, we posit:

Hypothesis 2 (H2): The interaction of founder 
involvement and severity will be positively associ-
ated with subsequent turnaround performance.

As firms age, the longer history of repeated human 
interactions gives rise to trust and cohesion but also 
obligations and expectations between the founder and 
key stakeholders of the firm (Coleman, 1990; Long, 
2011; Uzzi, 1997). These ties to internal and external 
stakeholders favor the emergence of social capital (i.e., 
goodwill such as “sympathy, trust, and forgiveness” that 
elicits “information, influence, and solidarity”; Adler & 

Kwon, 2002, p. 18). Although frequently argued to be a 
source of competitive advantage (Arregle et al., 2007; 
Nahapiet & Ghoshal, 1998; Pearson et al., 2008), social 
capital can turn into a significant liability when “con-
flicts over priorities” emerge—in other words, when 
obligations are not fulfilled according to expectation 
(Adler & Kwon, 2002, p. 31).

Although founders’ entrepreneurial identities might 
change slightly over time to incorporate the emerging 
social ties to organizational constituents (Markus & 
Wurf, 1987), we argue that founders should largely 
maintain “their identities [as entrepreneurs] in their cur-
rent state to achieve a sense of stability and continuity 
over time” (Petriglieri, 2011, p. 644; Shamir et al., 1993; 
Smeekes & Verkuyten, 2015). Thus, when an existential 
crisis arises in a more mature firm, a preference for bold 
turnaround responses, such as deeply cutting headcount, 
would be at odds with and appear unjustified to stake-
holders who expect mutual support (Long, 2011). Such 
“broken agreements and the violation of trust” would 
corrupt emerging social contexts, induce resistance 
instead of vital support from key stakeholders, and 
therefore, diminish turnaround prospects (Ford et  al., 
2008 p. 365; Pajunen, 2006). By contrast, social con-
texts and expectations of mutual support in younger 
firms are less evolved due to a shorter history of human 
interactions, leading to less-pronounced negative reso-
nance to overly holistic turnaround responses ensuing 
from founder involvement (Coleman, 1990; Uzzi, 1997). 
Thus, we posit:

Hypothesis 3 (H3): The interaction of founder 
involvement and firm age will be negatively associ-
ated with subsequent turnaround performance.

Turnaround Performance and Founding 
Family Involvement

The way in which founding family members advocate 
retrenchment and recovery responses should also align 
with the content of their leaders’ familial identities of 
being interdependent, cohesive, and stable (Miller et al., 
2011). These identity meanings include the duty to 
assume responsibility for those who have worked loy-
ally and respectfully for the firm and are misaligned 
with employee retrenchment turnaround responses. 
Instead, we argue that the involvement of founding fam-
ily members increases the preference for turnaround 
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strategies that are based on togetherness, collective sac-
rifice, and joint effort: strategies that minimize employee 
retrenchment and are typically regarded as “responsible 
restructuring” (Block, 2010; Cascio, 2002). This empha-
sis on cohesion and commitment to employees, suppli-
ers, and other stakeholders complies with their evolved 
expectations of solidarity and mutual support. Therefore, 
these strategies avoid conflicts over priorities (as in the 
case of founder involvement), and instead evoke conso-
nance with priorities regarding the charted course (Adler 
& Kwon, 2002; Helliwell et al., 2014). This consonance 
should enable firms to exploit the positive potential of 
the nurtured relationships with organizational stake-
holders, as the corresponding underlying norms of reci-
procity induce these stakeholders to offer vital lifelines 
to “their” organization (Arregle et al., 2007; Gouldner, 
1960). In particular, when a firm with continued found-
ing family involvement is threatened, the beneficial out-
comes of leveraged social capital may include 
renouncing increases in salary, increasing work effort 
(Cater & Schwab, 2008), remaining lenient on outstand-
ing bills, or even raising credit (Greif, 1989; Pajunen, 
2006). As such, social capital endowment should consti-
tute a unique performance advantage in light of found-
ing family involvement, driving turnaround performance 
compared to other firms that are generally more 
restrained from garnering this particular resource 
(Ahrens et  al., 2019; Habbershon & Williams, 1999; 
Pearson et al., 2008). Therefore, we posit:

Hypothesis 4 (H4): Founding family involvement 
will be positively associated with subsequent turn-
around performance.

Organizational recovery becomes challenging with 
the increasing severity of the turnaround situation, and 
the collapse of the firm and its social context become a 
viable threat. In such cases, the more protective response 
emphasizing togetherness that is associated with found-
ing family involvement should induce key stakeholders 
to mobilize larger resource reserves and offer greater loy-
alty, commitment, and effort to the organization. Thus, 
when a turnaround situation intensifies, carefully nur-
tured relationships with organizational constituents 
(Miller & Le Breton-Miller, 2005) should allow such 
firms to be particularly resilient compared to other firms 
that cannot draw upon similar degrees of social capital 
with organizational stakeholders (Lins et al., 2017). Key 

employees in firms with continued founding family 
involvement should be more motivated to remain com-
mitted, diligent, and supportive to preserve its core func-
tions (Lindström & Giordano, 2016; Nelson, 1989). 
Usually, a drain of human capital from a severely strug-
gling firm would inflict detrimental attrition as individu-
als search for shelter from the storm (Arogyaswamy 
et al., 1995). As the severity of the turnaround situation 
increases, the turnaround response promoted by found-
ing family members should intensify reciprocal solidar-
ity and cohesion (Adler & Kwon, 2002), making the firm 
more resilient (Aldrich & Meyer, 2015) and its turn-
around performance superior to that of firms without 
founder and family involvement (Hoffman et al., 2006; 
Sorenson & Bierman, 2009). Accordingly, we posit:

Hypothesis 5 (H5): The interaction of founding fam-
ily involvement and severity will be positively asso-
ciated with subsequent turnaround performance.

As time elapses and familial influence continues to 
be reflected in business practices, social capital endow-
ment becomes more pronounced because of a longer 
history of repeated human interactions (Arregle et  al., 
2007; Chrisman et al., 2012). Moreover, by sustainably 
treasuring evolved relationships and passing on familial 
values, norms, and obligations to subsequent genera-
tions, family members can maintain and accumulate 
additional social capital over time (Ahrens et al., 2019). 
Therefore, the performance advantage of founding fam-
ily involvement in turnaround situations should be even 
more pronounced as the firm matures and social capital 
becomes more abundant. Thus, we posit:

Hypothesis 6 (H6): The interaction of founding fam-
ily involvement and firm age will be positively asso-
ciated with subsequent turnaround performance.

Methodology

Sample Selection

We began our data collection with all nonfinancial S&P 
1,500 firms in the COMPUSTAT database between 
1994 and 2017. Among them, we singled out those in 
turnaround situations according to the definition of 
Chen and Hambrick (2012): firms that perform satisfac-
torily (a firm’s return on equity exceeds costs of equity 
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[COEs]) for 2 years, followed by 1 year of operating 
losses before extraordinary items. We followed the work 
of Fama and French (2018) and utilized a multifactor 
asset-pricing model involving the five risk factors of 
Fama and French (2015) and a momentum factor 
(Carhart, 1997) to estimate COE based on 60 months of 
return observations using the CRSP database. The mea-
surement of equity values was based on the studies by J. 
L. Davis et  al. (2000) and Vuolteenaho (2002). The 
Variable Booklet Table provided at the end of this sec-
tion offers in-depth technical information on these (and 
all other) variables.

Disregarding cases with missing values and firms 
that generated more than 50% of sales outside their pri-
mary industry to ensure that industry controls remain 
functional (Chen & Hambrick, 2012; Demerjian et al., 
2012; Zhang & Rajagopalan, 2004) yielded an overall 
sample comprising 190 cases of substantially troubled 
firms between fiscal years 1996 and 2012 (the first year 
of the turnaround situation was denoted as Year 0). 
Inspections of these firms supported the effectiveness of 
our applied sampling routine. The majority experienced 
a high likelihood of default (Altman, 1968) and a sharp 
performance decline in Year 0 (average performance 
dropped by almost 60%); many even experience a sus-
tained phase of losses across subsequent periods. We 
analyzed turnaround performance from Year +2 until 
Year +5 (i.e., 760 observations in total) because turn-
around measures usually take a minimum of 2 years to 
take effect and are conventionally inspected up to 5 
years after the decline (Morrow et al., 2004).

Dependent Variable

Turnaround performance was measured as (abnormal) 
returns on assets (ROA). ROA is a popular indicator of 
operating profitability and ensured our results would be 
comparable to the extant literature on turnarounds (e.g., 
Love & Nohria, 2005; Winn, 1997). ROA is especially 
suitable in our context because other equity-based mea-
sures employed in turnaround situations (e.g., Chen & 
Hambrick, 2012) might readily be suspected of suffer-
ing from strategic equity-related decisions unrelated to 
fundamental firm performance due to the desire of 
founders and founder descendants to retain control. 
Therefore, ROA is frequently preferred in event studies 
on founder and founding family member involvement 

(e.g., Pérez-González, 2006). We considered that the 
plain performance measures of substantially troubled 
firms are affected by mean reversion; that is, perfor-
mance trends solely attributable to performance revert-
ing to the mean (Huson et al., 2004). Accordingly, we 
adjusted our dependent variable for industry and perfor-
mance trends to capture abnormal performance (ROA) 
free from mean-reverting tendencies (see the Variable 
Booklet Table; Barber & Lyon, 1996).

Independent Variables

Founder and Founding Family Involvement.  We followed the 
operationalization in several contemporary debate-lead-
ing articles (e.g., Anderson & Reeb, 2003; Miller et al., 
2007; Miller & Le Breton-Miller, 2011; Pérez-González, 
2006; Villalonga & Amit, 2006) to identify founder and 
founding family involvement while maximizing the com-
parability of our research. Specifically, we began by 
hand-collecting information on corporate management, 
boards, and ownership from SEC filings (U.S. Securities 
and Exchange Commission) in the EDGAR database 
(Electronic Data Gathering, Analysis, and Retrival) and 
determined founder involvement when a founder served 
as the CEO, was in the management team, on the board of 
directors, or held more than 5% of a firm’s voting rights 
(Miller et  al., 2011). Correspondingly, founding family 
involvement was coded as one if a founder’s family mem-
ber satisfied any of the aforementioned conditions. To 
code these variables, we first assessed company websites, 
fundinguniverse.com, and the Hoover firm profile data-
base to identify founders and potential founding family 
members. Subsequently, we investigated 10-K filings for 
management and board information, and DEF 14A filings 
(proxy statements) for ownership structures. Companies 
with origins in mergers, spin-offs, and carve-outs were 
excluded because of their natural unavailability of founder 
information. Furthermore, owing to incomplete data cov-
erage throughout the phase-in period of the EDGAR data-
base (https://www.sec.gov/edgar/aboutedgar.htm), our 
classification began with the fiscal year 1996. Including 
these two binary indicators in our main regressions natu-
rally selected all firms without founder and founding fam-
ily involvement as the comparison group. In the 
supplemental analyses, we also considered ancillary 
meso- and micro-level differentiations of founder and 
founding family member involvement constellations.

https://www.sec.gov/edgar/aboutedgar.htm
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Severity.  We referred to the study by Chen and Ham-
brick (2012) and measured a firm’s turnaround severity 
by reverse-coding plain ROA in the year of the onset of 
the turnaround situation (Year 0).

Firm Age.  We conducted manual web searches to code a 
firm’s age (in years) since inception, which served as a 
proxy for the maturity of a firm’s social context (Free-
man et al., 1983; Thornhill & Amit, 2003).

Control Variables

Following the turnaround literature, we included a com-
prehensive control vector addressing the firm, industry, 
and CEO levels. At the firm level, we controlled for 
resource endowment by including firm size (log-trans-
formed sales), quick ratio (short-term liquidity divided 
by total current liabilities), and leverage ratio (debt to 
equity; Audia & Greve, 2006). Altman’s (1968) Z-Score 
proxied an organization’s risk of default and pre-crisis 
performance (mean ROA for Years 2 and 1) served as a 
measure of fundamental organizational strength (Chen 
& Hambrick, 2012). To delineate an internal or external 
reason for the crisis (Pearce & Robbins, 1993), we 
included cost crisis and revenue crisis indicators that 
were “true” if there was a pronounced cost or revenue 
issue, respectively, in Year 0 compared to the base case 
when neither situation was evident (see the Variable 
Booklet Table). CEO replacement in Year 0 controlled 
for subsequent effects of CEO turnover (Brickley, 2003). 
S&P 500 constituent controlled for effects of high-pro-
file firms among general S&P 1,500 constituents (Fama 
& French, 1993).

At the industry level, we followed Dess and Beard 
(1984) and Krishnan et al. (2006) and regressed industry 
sales at the two-digit SIC level against time and divided 
the standard error of the regression coefficient by mean 
industry sales to obtain a proxy for the industry’s dyna-
mism (market uncertainty). To delineate industries in 
fundamental turmoil, struggling industry showed that, 
in Year 0 and the 2 years preceding the turnaround situ-
ation, the median COE at the two-digit SIC industry 
level of all COMPUSTAT and CRSP firms was above 
the median return on equity (Chen & Hambrick, 2012; 
Morrow et al., 2004; Schmitt & Raisch, 2013). In addi-
tion, calculated across all COMPUSTAT firms and fol-
lowing the work of Palmer and Wiseman (1999), market 
competitiveness was specified as the number of rival 

firms within the focal firm’s main industry divided by 
1,000 and controlled for corporate strategic behavior 
and corresponding performance implications (Ferrier, 
2001; Hambrick & Finkelstein, 1987). Further industry 
controls included market munificence, calculated as the 
exponentiated slope of a regression of log-transformed 
COMPUSTAT two-digit SIC industry sales against time 
for the previous 5 fiscal years (Keats & Hitt, 1988; Li & 
Tang, 2010), and market concentration, specified by the 
Herfindahl-Hirschman Index (Karpoff et al., 2017). At 
the CEO level, we captured heterogeneity related to ten-
ure, measured in years (according to ExecuComp, SEC 
filings, and supplementary web searches); the duality of 
the CEO and board-chair positions, collected via 
ExecuComp’s “titleann” variable and complemented 
with manual searches in SEC filings (Peters & Wagner, 
2014); and CEO talent, following the approach of 
Garvey and Milbourn (2006), which is outlined in-depth 
in the Variable Booklet Table, to control for respective 
performance implications (e.g., Zhu & Chen, 2015).

Naturally, the observation of turnaround performance 
was restricted to firms that survived the crisis. Thus, to 
capture the effects of sampling-induced endogeneity, we 
correct for this non-random sample composition by 
including an inverse Mills ratio (Heckman, 1979) based 
on the estimation of a firm’s probability of displaying 
performance across our event window. The specification 
of this selection equation, outlined in full detail in the 
Variable Booklet Table, satisfied the criteria for valid 
exclusion restrictions (Certo et  al., 2016; Wolfolds & 
Siegel, 2019) and yielded a control for survivorship bias 
(Heckman, 1976).

Furthermore, founder or founding family member 
involvement might be more likely for some firms than 
for others. We controlled for this unobserved heteroge-
neity by predicting the likelihood of their occurrence 
(Elze et al., 2017). In particular, we calculate probit esti-
mations of founder and founding family involvement on 
an array of antecedent variables: (a) firm characteristics 
(i.e., pre-crisis performance, firm size, quick ratio, 
leverage ratio, revenue diversification, cost crisis, reve-
nue crisis), and the ratio of market value of equity by 
total liabilities (Altman, 1968); (b) industrial character-
istics (i.e., market resource availability, market competi-
tiveness, and struggling industry); (c) CEO characteristics 
(i.e., CEO duality, tenure, age, and talent); and (d) the 
correction for survivorship bias. The predicted values of 
these two models were included in our main regressions 
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as a propensity score covariate adjustment (PSCA; 
Chatterjee & Hambrick, 2007; Chen & Hambrick, 2012; 
Gerstner et al., 2013; Tang et al., 2018).

Empirical Strategy

An initial assessment using Breusch-Pagan Lagrangian 
multiplier tests (Breusch & Pagan, 1980) revealed that 
the data were not poolable, ruling out ordinary least 
squares (OLS) estimations. Moreover, Wooldridge tests 
revealed a first-order serial correlation of the error terms 
(Drukker, 2003; Wooldridge, 2002). Hence, since our 
key predictor variables displayed high degrees of tem-
poral stability, we applied generalized estimating equa-
tions (GEEs; Crossland et  al., 2014), which derive 
maximum likelihood estimates while accounting for 
autoregressive correlation structures observed in the 
error terms that would otherwise yield overly optimistic 
results (Liang & Zeger, 1986). GEE are even advocated 
as “especially appropriate” for the type of data we inves-
tigated (Miller & Le Breton-Miller, 2011, p. 1066). 
Accordingly, we parameterized GEE using a Gaussian 
distribution of the regress and, an identity link function, 
a covariance structure addressing first-order autocorre-
lation and heteroskedasticity-robust standard errors 
(Huber, 1967; White, 1980). Nevertheless, our findings 
based on GEE remained robust when employing more 
naïve OLS estimations, with standard errors clustered at 
the firm level, or random-effects regressions. According 
to the condition numbers and variance inflation factors, 
multicollinearity concerns were dismissed (Belsley 
et al., 2005; O’Brien, 2007). All specifications included 
year indicators (Year +5 was omitted), and the continu-
ous variables and interactions were mean centered to 
facilitate their assessment.

Data Analysis

Results

Table 1 displays the descriptive statistics and correlations. 
Table 2 presents the results of our main regressions.

Model 1 contained all control variables and subse-
quent moderators. Model 2 tested the main effects of 
founder involvement and founding family involvement 
on subsequent abnormal turnaround performance. The 
negative and marginally significant relationship between 
founder involvement and abnormal ROA (Model 2; β = 
−.031; p = .058) supports the theoretical reasoning 

outlined in H1. In terms of effect size, compared to cases 
without founder and founding family involvement, 
founder involvement was associated with an inferior 
abnormal ROA of 3.1 percentage points. Albeit contrary 
to our postulations, the main effect of founding family 
involvement on abnormal ROA was insignificant (Model 
2; β = .009; p = .677). This means that the average 
turnaround performance in firms with founding family 
involvement is (at this general level) not significantly 
different from that of firms without founding family 
involvement. We return to this coherence in more fine-
grained meso- and micro-level collateral analyses in the 
following sections, where we find support for H4 for the 
sub-case of post-founder multiple founding family 
member involvement.

In Models 3 and 4, we analyzed the contingency 
effects as outlined in H2 and H5 (severity), and in H3 
and H6 (firm age). In support of our argumentation 
behind H2, the interaction of founder involvement and 
severity in Model 3 was significantly positively related 
to performance (Model 3; β = .032; p = .013). In sup-
port of H5, we also found a significantly positive inter-
action effect of founding family involvement and severity 
on abnormal ROA (Model 3; β = .042; p = .034). We 
visualize the economic significance and magnitude of 
these effects in Figure 2A, assuming mean values for all 
control variables. Figure 2A shows that, in general, the 
average turnaround firm tends to perform slightly better 
when the severity of the decline is higher; however, this 
increase in turnaround performance is greater in firms 
with founder or founding family involvement, or both, 
than in firms without such involvement. This is note-
worthy because founder involvement appears to aggra-
vate crises in low-severity situations, and because it 
sheds light on the insignificant base effect of founding 
family involvement in Model 2.

Model 4 incorporated the interactions between firm 
age and founder and founding family involvement. 
While the interaction of firm age and founder involve-
ment is significantly negatively related to abnormal 
ROA (Model 4; β = −.040; p = .023), the coefficient of 
the interaction between firm age and founding family 
involvement is positive and significant (Model 4; β = 
.046; p = .017), providing empirical evidence corrobo-
rating H3 and H6. The magnitudes of these effects are 
shown in Figure 2B. Correspondingly, Figure 2B shows 
that the average firms’ turnaround performance is largely 
unrelated to firm age. However, turnaround performance 
deteriorated harshly in the case of founder involvement, 



16	

T
ab

le
 1

. 
D

es
cr

ip
tiv

e 
St

at
is

tic
s 

an
d 

Pa
ir

w
is

e 
C

or
re

la
tio

ns
.

N
r.

V
ar

ia
bl

es
M

SD
1

2
3

4
5

6
7

8
9

10
11

12
13

14
15

16

1
A

bn
or

m
al

 R
O

A
0.

04
0.

13
 

2
Pr

e-
cr

is
is

 p
er

fo
rm

an
ce

0.
14

0.
08

0.
13

 
3

Se
ve

ri
ty

–0
.0

3
0.

10
0.

10
–0

.1
4

 
4

Fi
rm

 s
iz

e 
(ln

)
7.

36
1.

51
0.

09
–0

.0
3

–0
.3

0
 

5
S&

P 
50

0 
co

ns
tit

ue
nt

0.
46

0.
50

0.
02

0.
10

–0
.1

3
0.

67
 

6
Fi

rm
 a

ge
54

.6
4

39
.2

6
0.

02
–0

.1
8

–0
.1

8
0.

35
0.

24
 

7
Q

ui
ck

 r
at

io
1.

74
1.

53
0.

11
0.

15
0.

18
–0

.3
7

–0
.1

8
–0

.3
6

 
8

Le
ve

ra
ge

 r
at

io
0.

37
0.

48
–0

.0
7

–0
.0

7
–0

.1
3

0.
13

0.
10

0.
23

–0
.2

3
 

9
A

ltm
an

 Z
-s

co
re

4.
03

4.
32

0.
44

0.
27

–0
.0

3
–0

.0
4

0.
02

–0
.1

7
0.

44
–0

.3
3

 
10

C
os

t 
cr

is
is

0.
52

0.
50

0.
04

–0
.0

1
0.

02
0.

07
0.

10
0.

00
–0

.0
5

0.
07

–0
.0

9
 

11
R

ev
en

ue
 c

ri
si

s
0.

38
0.

49
–0

.0
8

0.
08

0.
18

–0
.0

7
–0

.0
9

–0
.0

3
0.

07
–0

.0
8

0.
09

–0
.8

1
 

12
St

ru
gg

lin
g 

in
du

st
ry

0.
56

0.
50

0.
09

0.
03

0.
11

–0
.0

6
0.

01
–0

.1
4

0.
16

–0
.1

2
0.

13
–0

.1
7

0.
18

 
13

M
ar

ke
t 

m
un

ifi
ce

nc
e

1.
04

0.
05

0.
07

0.
02

–0
.0

9
0.

00
–0

.0
1

–0
.1

0
–0

.0
5

–0
.1

1
0.

03
0.

13
–0

.2
0

0.
10

 
14

M
ar

ke
t 

co
m

pe
tit

iv
en

es
s

0.
40

0.
31

0.
19

0.
11

–0
.0

2
–0

.2
8

–0
.1

4
–0

.2
2

0.
30

–0
.1

5
0.

18
0.

02
–0

.1
2

0.
39

0.
18

 
15

M
ar

ke
t 

co
nc

en
tr

at
io

n
94

1.
59

4,
41

3.
31

–0
.0

5
–0

.0
3

–0
.0

6
0.

02
0.

03
0.

13
–0

.0
7

0.
00

–0
.0

6
–0

.0
2

0.
03

–0
.1

5
–0

.2
2

–0
.2

3
 

16
M

ar
ke

t 
un

ce
rt

ai
nt

y
6.

18
6.

12
0.

05
0.

09
0.

18
–0

.1
7

–0
.0

9
–0

.2
1

0.
28

–0
.1

2
0.

14
–0

.0
9

0.
10

0.
42

–0
.1

4
0.

59
–0

.1
6

 
17

M
ill

s 
ra

tio
 (

su
rv

iv
or

sh
ip

)
–0

.4
4

0.
18

–0
.0

5
0.

08
–0

.1
8

0.
09

0.
14

–0
.0

8
0.

12
0.

00
0.

06
–0

.3
0

0.
30

0.
51

–0
.0

5
0.

22
–0

.1
8

0.
30

 
V

ar
ia

bl
es

17
18

19
20

21
22

23
24

18
C

EO
 t

en
ur

e
8.

36
6.

82
–0

.0
1

–0
.0

2
0.

07
–0

.1
4

–0
.1

7
–0

.1
6

0.
07

–0
.0

7
0.

07
0.

01
–0

.0
1

0.
09

0.
03

0.
05

0.
02

0.
06

19
C

EO
 d

ua
lit

y
0.

57
0.

50
–0

.0
1

0.
04

–0
.0

6
0.

22
0.

28
0.

24
–0

.1
4

0.
08

–0
.0

6
–0

.0
4

–0
.0

2
0.

11
0.

00
–0

.0
2

0.
02

–0
.0

2
20

C
EO

 t
al

en
t

0.
00

0.
02

–0
.0

5
0.

16
0.

05
–0

.0
9

–0
.0

6
–0

.1
2

0.
16

–0
.0

6
0.

12
–0

.0
5

0.
03

0.
02

–0
.0

1
0.

09
0.

01
0.

15
21

C
EO

 r
ep

la
ce

m
en

t
0.

17
0.

38
–0

.0
7

–0
.0

2
–0

.1
3

0.
04

0.
05

0.
11

–0
.1

0
–0

.0
7

–0
.0

4
–0

.0
3

0.
01

–0
.1

0
–0

.0
5

–0
.0

5
0.

11
–0

.0
6

22
PS

C
A

 fo
un

d.
–0

.6
0

0.
82

–0
.0

4
0.

03
0.

08
–0

.2
6

–0
.2

5
–0

.4
1

0.
31

–0
.2

4
0.

18
0.

04
–0

.0
8

0.
28

0.
14

0.
37

–0
.1

1
0.

32
23

PS
C

A
 fa

m
.

–1
.6

2
1.

17
0.

00
–0

.1
0

–0
.0

7
0.

16
0.

03
0.

12
–0

.4
6

0.
05

–0
.0

2
0.

03
–0

.0
6

0.
00

0.
07

–0
.4

2
0.

10
–0

.1
9

24
Fo

un
de

r 
in

vo
lv

em
en

t
0.

31
0.

46
–0

.0
9

0.
01

0.
04

–0
.1

4
–0

.1
2

–0
.4

5
0.

23
–0

.1
2

0.
08

0.
01

–0
.0

3
0.

16
0.

06
0.

18
–0

.0
9

0.
23

25
Fo

un
di

ng
 fa

m
ily

 in
vo

lv
em

en
t

0.
12

0.
33

0.
05

–0
.0

1
–0

.0
3

0.
02

–0
.1

2
–0

.0
1

–0
.0

5
–0

.0
4

0.
08

0.
00

–0
.0

6
0.

00
0.

08
–0

.1
7

0.
01

–0
.0

5
18

C
EO

 t
en

ur
e

0.
02

 
19

C
EO

 d
ua

lit
y

0.
11

0.
25

 
20

C
EO

 t
al

en
t

0.
12

0.
20

0.
09

 
21

C
EO

 r
ep

la
ce

m
en

t
0.

00
–0

.1
3

0.
01

–0
.1

1
 

22
PS

C
A

 fo
un

d.
0.

10
0.

73
–0

.2
0

0.
20

–0
.1

6
 

23
PS

C
A

 fa
m

.
–0

.0
1

0.
27

–0
.1

0
0.

05
–0

.0
3

0.
11

 
24

Fo
un

de
r 

in
vo

lv
em

en
t

0.
06

0.
41

–0
.0

8
0.

11
–0

.1
0

0.
53

0.
05

 
25

Fo
un

di
ng

 fa
m

ily
 in

vo
lv

em
en

t
–0

.0
7

0.
15

–0
.1

0
0.

05
–0

.0
8

0.
14

0.
31

0.
13

N
ot

e.
 N

 =
 7

60
. C

or
re

la
tio

ns
 a

bo
ve

 (
be

lo
w

) 
.0

7 
(−

.0
7)

 a
re

 s
ig

ni
fic

an
t 

at
 t

he
 5

%
 le

ve
l.



Ahrens et al.	 17

Table 2.  Turnaround Performance and Founder and Founding Family Involvement.

Variables

Abnormal ROA

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)

Pre-crisis performance 0.20**
(0.10)

0.19*
(0.10)

0.15*
(0.09)

0.20**
(0.10)

0.17*
(0.09)

Severity (standardized) 0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.02*
(0.01)

0.03***
(0.01)

0.02*
(0.01)

Firm size (ln) 0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

S&P 500 constituent –0.05***
(0.02)

–0.05***
(0.02)

–0.05***
(0.02)

–0.05***
(0.02)

–0.05***
(0.02)

Firm age (ln and standardized) –0.00
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

Quick ratio 0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

Leverage ratio 0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

Altman Z-Score 0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

Cost crisis –0.05**
(0.02)

–0.05**
(0.02)

–0.05**
(0.02)

–0.05**
(0.02)

–0.05**
(0.02)

Revenue crisis –0.08***
(0.03)

–0.08***
(0.03)

–0.08***
(0.03)

–0.08***
(0.03)

–0.08***
(0.02)

Struggling industry 0.02
(0.02)

0.02
(0.02)

0.03
(0.02)

0.02
(0.02)

0.03
(0.02)

Market munificence –0.00
(0.10)

–0.01
(0.10)

–0.00
(0.11)

0.02
(0.10)

0.02
(0.11)

Market competitiveness 0.18***
(0.04)

0.18***
(0.04)

0.17***
(0.04)

0.19***
(0.04)

0.19***
(0.04)

Market concentration 0.00
(0.00)

0.00
(0.00)

0.00
(0.00)

0.00
(0.00)

0.00
(0.00)

Market uncertainty –0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

Mills ratio (survivorship) –0.03
(0.04)

–0.03
(0.04)

–0.04
(0.04)

–0.04
(0.04)

–0.04
(0.04)

CEO tenure 0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

CEO duality –0.07***
(0.02)

–0.07***
(0.02)

–0.08***
(0.02)

–0.08***
(0.02)

–0.08***
(0.02)

CEO talent –0.69
(0.46)

–0.72
(0.46)

–0.74
(0.46)

–0.79*
(0.45)

–0.79*
(0.46)

CEO replacement –0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.02
(0.01)

–0.02
(0.01)

PSCA found. –0.11***
(0.02)

–0.11***
(0.02)

–0.11***
(0.02)

–0.12***
(0.02)

–0.12***
(0.02)

PSCA fam. 0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01*
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

Founder involvement –0.03*
(0.02)

–0.02
(0.02)

–0.05***
(0.02)

–0.04**
(0.02)

Founding family involvement 0.01
(0.02)

0.02
(0.02)

0.01
(0.02)

0.02
(0.02)

Severity × Founder involvement 0.03**
(0.01)

0.03*
(0.01)

Severity × Founding family involvement 0.04**
(0.02)

0.04**
(0.02)

Firm age × Founder involvement –0.04**
(0.02)

–0.04**
(0.02)

Firm age × Founding family involvement 0.05**
(0.02)

0.04*
(0.02)

Year-indicators Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Constant 0.17***
(0.03)

0.18***
(0.03)

0.17***
(0.03)

0.18***
(0.03)

0.17***
(0.03)

Observations 760 760 760 760 760

Wald χ2 192.80 210.27 240.94 243.60 273.26

Pseudo R2 (corr(y, ŷ)2) 0.40 0.40 0.43 0.42 0.44

Note. Robust standard errors in parentheses. ROA = returns on assets; PSCA = propensity score covariate adjustment.
*p < .1. **p < .05. ***p < .01.
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Figure 2.  Turnaround Performance Effect of Founder and Founding Family Involvement.

while firms with founding family involvement experi-
ence a sharp increase in turnaround performance when 
firm age was high (both compared to firms where this is 
not the case). In Model 5, we confirmed the indepen-
dence of the aforementioned effects by jointly including 
all predictor variables.

Collateral Analyses—Beyond the Polar View: 
The Landscape of Blended Identities

Family business literature acknowledges that the 
involvement of founders and founding family members 
can occur in heterogeneous constellations (Neubaum 
et al., 2019), causing entrepreneurial and familial identi-
ties to blend (Miller et al., 2011; Miller & Le Breton-
Miller, 2011). Technically, our main analyses captured 
such blended cases wherein founder and founding fam-
ily involvement were simultaneously present. However, 
in post hoc analyses, we further disentangled these cases 
to examine the insignificant effect of founding family 
involvement on a firm’s turnaround performance in our 
main analyses (H4).

Generally, we expected that the effects we theorized 
in H1 and H4 would be most salient when no such blend-
ing occurs. Moreover, as these hypothesized effects are 
of opposite direction, the compound effect in case of 
blending these identities should arguably lie between 
both “poles,” depending on which identity is more 
prominent. In this landscape of cases, the effect of “lone 

founders,” that is, founders without any other involved 
family member, should be closest to what we hypothe-
sized in H1, whereas cases of founders involved with a 
familial co-founder already entail some minor blending. 
“Classic” blended identities, that is, cases of joint 
involvement of the founder and founding family mem-
bers should arguably be located between both poles and 
may be further distinguished into cases where the 
founder holds greater voting power, the CEO position, 
or is involved in a less-dominant way. Finally, founding 
family involvement may also be distinguished into an 
archetypical “familial identity” with multiple founding 
family members involved without the firm’s founder 
(which is closest to the case hypothesized in H4) and in 
cases where there is a “lone founding family member,” 
that is, where the family involvement has, for some rea-
son, dried up (is lacking) and, hence, the familial iden-
tity is strongly blended with that of an entrepreneurial 
investor (or even a detached professional). Therefore, in 
line with our arguments in H1 and H4, we expect lone 
founder involvement to exert the most negative associa-
tion with subsequent turnaround performance, multiple 
founding family involvement (without founder involve-
ment) to exert the most positive association with subse-
quent turnaround performance, and blended cases to 
exhibit performance levels between these poles.

To test these rationales, we coded the ancillary meso- 
and micro-level differentiations of founder and founding 
family member involvement constellations. Specifically, 
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lone involvement is true when, besides founder involve-
ment or the lone involvement of a founding family 
member, no other member of the founding family is 
involved in the firm. Blended involvement is true when 
both a founder and a founding family member are jointly 
involved, and multiple founding family involvement is 
true when several members of the founding family are 
involved, but not the founder. We further zoomed in to 
differentiate between lone founder involvement, 
wherein, besides one founder, no other family member 
nor other family co-founder of the founding family is 
involved; lone founding family involvement, wherein, 
besides one founding family member, no other member 
of the founding family nor the founder is involved; 
founder with family co-founder involvement when there 
is involvement of multiple persons from one family as 
founders; and blended involvement with founder CEO 
and blended involvement when founder holds more votes 
(than involved family members) to delineate elevated 
founder involvement in blended cases. Finally, we coded 
founder CEO, founder has >5% voting rights, founding 
family CEO, and founding family has >5% voting rights 
as 1 when true.

The econometric capability to zoom in on these more 
fine-grained meso- and micro-level constellations was 
naturally limited given our study’s focus on firms in 
turnaround situations, which are relatively rare occur-
rences in a firm’s history. In our sample, we observed 53 
cases of founder involvement and 23 cases of founding 
family involvement. Table 3 provides a nuanced descrip-
tion of the sub-case numbers. In line with a conservative 
stance, we considered meso- and micro-level evidence 
as indicative, given the finite number of cases.

We report these results in Table 4. Model 1 presented 
meso-level specifications, finding a significant negative 
relationship between lone involvement and abnormal 
ROA (β = −.033; p = .033), and a significant positive 
relation for multiple founding family involvement (β = 
.044; p = .050), whereas the coefficient for blended 
involvement remained insignificant (β = −.031; p = 
.355). Disentangling the heterogeneity of founder and 
founding family involvement even further in Model 2, 
which covered micro-level categories, we found further 
evidence in line with our theorizing. Particularly, we 
found that lone founder involvement entails a significant 
negative relation with firms’ abnormal turnaround per-
formance (β = −.031; p = .053), whereas multiple 
founding family involvement had a significantly positive 
coefficient (β = .046; p = .044). The coefficients on all 
other micro categories remain insignificant, although it 
is notable that in blended involvement, the coefficient 
turns insignificantly positive when the founder neither 
holds the CEO position nor has more votes than the 
founding family members (β = .056; p = .537). 
Together, the evidence from these analyses aligns with 
earlier arguments on how heterogeneity in founder and 
founding family involvement leads to a blending of 
leader identities that affects organizational outcomes. 
Moreover, while the indicative nature of this evidence 
must be considered, it suggests that H4 might only be 
true for the sub-case of multiple founding family involve-
ment, although it cannot otherwise be confirmed. When 
multiple founding family members are involved in the 
post-founder phase, the turnaround performance is sig-
nificantly higher than that in cases where this is not the 
case.

Table 3.  Case Numbers.

Cases 0 1 2 3 4 ∑

Founder involvement 131 59 190
Founding family involvement 167 23 190
Lone involvement 138 52 190
  Lone founder involvement 145 45 190
  Founder with family co-founder involvement 187 3 190
  Lone founding family involvement 186 4 190
Blended involvement 179 11 190
  Blended involvement with founder CEO 185 5 190
  Blended involvement, founder holds more votes 181 9 190
Multiple founding family involvement 182 8 190
Generation 119 51 11 7 2 190
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Table 4.  Collateral Analyses.

Variables

Abnormal ROA

Meso Micro Position Robustness

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)

Pre-crisis performance 0.20**
(0.09)

0.20**
(0.09)

0.21**
(0.10)

0.18*
(0.10)

0.15*
(0.09)

Severity (standardized) 0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.02*
(0.01)

Firm size (ln) 0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

0.04***
(0.01)

S&P 500 constituent –0.05***
(0.02)

–0.05***
(0.02)

–0.04***
(0.02)

–0.05***
(0.02)

–0.05***
(0.02)

Firm age (ln and standardized) –0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

Quick ratio 0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

Leverage ratio 0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

Altman Z-Score 0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

0.01***
(0.00)

Cost crisis –0.05**
(0.02)

–0.05**
(0.02)

–0.06**
(0.02)

–0.05**
(0.02)

–0.05**
(0.02)

Revenue crisis –0.08***
(0.03)

–0.08***
(0.03)

–0.09***
(0.03)

–0.08***
(0.03)

–0.08***
(0.03)

Struggling industry 0.02
(0.02)

0.02
(0.02)

0.03
(0.02)

0.02
(0.02)

0.03
(0.02)

Market munificence –0.01
(0.10)

–0.01
(0.10)

–0.01
(0.11)

0.01
(0.10)

0.01
(0.10)

Market competitiveness 0.18***
(0.04)

0.19***
(0.04)

0.18***
(0.04)

0.18***
(0.04)

0.18***
(0.04)

Market concentration 0.00
(0.00)

0.00
(0.00)

0.00
(0.00)

0.00
(0.00)

0.00
(0.00)

Market uncertainty –0.00 –0.00 –0.00 –0.00 –0.00
  (0.00) (0.00) (0.00) (0.00) (0.00)
Mills ratio (survivorship) –0.04 –0.03 –0.04 –0.03 –0.04
  (0.04) (0.05) (0.04) (0.04) (0.04)
CEO tenure 0.01*** 0.01*** 0.01*** 0.01*** 0.01***
  (0.00) (0.00) (0.00) (0.00) (0.00)
CEO duality –0.07***

(0.02)
–0.07***
(0.02)

–0.08***
(0.02)

–0.08***
(0.02)

–0.08***
(0.02)

CEO talent –0.72
(0.45)

–0.74
(0.45)

–0.72
(0.46)

–0.75
(0.46)

–0.76
(0.46)

CEO replacement –0.02
(0.01)

–0.02
(0.01)

–0.01
(0.01)

–0.02
(0.01)

–0.02
(0.01)

PSCA found. –0.11***
(0.02)

–0.11***
(0.02)

–0.11***
(0.02)

–0.12***
(0.02)

–0.12***
(0.02)

PSCA fam. 0.01*
(0.01)

0.01*
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

0.01*
(0.01)

0.01
(0.01)

Family generation 0.02*
(0.01)

0.02
(0.01)

Lone involvement –0.03**
(0.02)

 

Lone founder involvement –0.03*
(0.02)

 

Founder with family co-founder involvement –0.07
(0.09)

 

(continued)
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Model 3 further distinguished between the positions 
taken by founders and founding family members using 
voting rights above 5% and CEO indicators. Therein, 
only the coefficient of the founder has >5% voting 
rights indicator was statistically significant (β = −.052; 
p = .033), providing more specificity regarding the neg-
ative effect of their involvement in turnaround cases. 
Moreover, Models 4 and 5 in Table 4 demonstrate that 
our main results for H1–H4 remain essentially 
unchanged when controlling for the family generation 
involved in the firm. Because of the inevitable correla-
tion between the family generation variable and our 
moderator, firm age, we refrained from re-assessing H5 
and H6 after controlling for family generation since the 

ensuing results would be obscured by multicollinearity 
in the respective variable of interest.

To further substantiate the theoretical reasoning 
underlying our hypotheses beyond these analyses and 
elaborate on the behavioral mechanisms, we investi-
gated the specific turnaround responses to depict how 
founder and founding family involvement affect turn-
around strategies (Table 5). We systematically searched 
the Factiva database to identify whether a set of 
employee retrenchment, asset retrenchment, and recov-
ery actions had been implemented by the sample firms 
in years 0 until +3. In total, 7.744 manually assessed 
articles pointed to these turnaround actions being imple-
mented by our sample firms. The panel probit regression 

Variables

Abnormal ROA

Meso Micro Position Robustness

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)

Lone founding family involvement –0.05
(0.05)

 

Blended involvement –0.03
(0.03)

0.06
(0.09)

 

Blended involvement, founder holds more votes –0.08
(0.10)

 

Blended involvement with founder CEO –0.04
(0.05)

 

Multiple founding family involvement 0.04*
(0.02)

0.05**
(0.02)

 

Founder CEO –0.00
(0.02)

 

Founder has >5% voting rights –0.05**
(0.02)

 

Founding family CEO 0.01
(0.03)

 

Founding family has >5% voting rights 0.01
(0.02)

 

Founder involvement –0.05**
(0.02)

–0.04*
(0.02)

Founding family involvement –0.04
(0.03)

–0.01
(0.03)

Severity × Founder involvement 0.03**
(0.01)

Severity × Founding family involvement 0.04**
(0.02)

Year indicators Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Constant 0.18***

(0.03)
0.18***

(0.03)
0.18***

(0.03)
0.19***

(0.03)
0.18***

(0.03)
Observations 760 760 760 760 760
Wald χ2 216.00 248.44 221.96 220.79 250.38
Pseudo R2 (corr(y, ŷ)2) 0.41 0.42 0.41 0.41 0.43

Note. Robust standard errors in parentheses. ROA = returns on assets; PSCA = propensity score covariate adjustment.
*p < .1. **p < .05. ***p < .01.

Table 4.  (continued)
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Table 5.  Effect of Founder and Founding Family Involvement on Turnaround Strategy.

Variables

Employee retrenchment Asset retrenchment Recovery

Layoffs
New wage 
agreements

SG&A 
reductions

R&D 
reductions

Inventory 
reductions

General asset 
reductions

Selling or 
closing plants 
or business 

units

New 
products and 

services Re-positioning

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) (8) (9)

Pre-crisis performance –0.14
(1.30)

–1.71
(2.14)

0.76
(1.72)

–3.88
(3.85)

0.58
(2.49)

–1.21
(2.96)

0.69
(1.29)

–2.38*
(1.33)

–1.74
(1.45)

Severity (standardized) 0.17
(0.11)

–0.16
(0.19)

–0.03
(0.15)

0.05
(0.36)

0.52**
(0.23)

0.16
(0.24)

0.05
(0.11)

0.11
(0.12)

–0.14
(0.14)

Firm size (ln) 0.16*
(0.09)

–0.21
(0.15)

–0.23*
(0.13)

–0.01
(0.25)

0.30*
(0.17)

–0.16
(0.20)

–0.05
(0.09)

0.16*
(0.09)

0.11
(0.10)

S&P 500 constituent 0.22
(0.25)

0.58
(0.39)

0.28
(0.33)

1.43*
(0.77)

–0.34
(0.48)

0.84
(0.54)

0.36
(0.23)

0.35
(0.26)

0.18
(0.28)

Firm age (ln and standardized) 0.12
(0.12)

0.27
(0.19)

0.45***
(0.17)

0.18
(0.35)

0.19
(0.23)

0.21
(0.25)

0.40***
(0.12)

–0.17
(0.13)

0.07
(0.14)

Quick ratio 0.03
(0.08)

–0.04
(0.15)

–0.10
(0.13)

0.44**
(0.19)

0.11
(0.15)

–0.14
(0.24)

0.01
(0.10)

–0.02
(0.07)

–0.05
(0.09)

Leverage ratio 0.15
(0.21)

0.14
(0.34)

0.81**
(0.37)

0.07
(0.67)

0.56
(0.41)

0.87*
(0.46)

0.20
(0.24)

0.02
(0.24)

0.26
(0.27)

Altman Z-Score –0.09***
(0.03)

–0.02
(0.05)

–0.04
(0.05)

–0.11
(0.08)

–0.01
(0.06)

0.05
(0.06)

–0.08**
(0.04)

–0.00
(0.02)

0.02
(0.03)

Cost crisis –0.16
(0.33)

–0.70
(0.48)

0.43
(0.46)

0.61
(1.08)

–0.23
(0.62)

0.97
(0.90)

–0.39
(0.31)

–0.26
(0.33)

–0.02
(0.33)

Revenue crisis 0.47
(0.39)

–0.37
(0.57)

–0.09
(0.54)

0.91
(1.24)

–0.04
(0.72)

0.49
(1.01)

0.04
(0.37)

0.17
(0.38)

–0.03
(0.39)

Struggling industry –0.54**
(0.25)

0.35
(0.41)

0.32
(0.33)

0.18
(0.72)

–0.38
(0.46)

–0.32
(0.55)

–0.12
(0.24)

0.11
(0.26)

–0.52*
(0.29)

Market munificence 1.24
(1.79)

1.20
(3.11)

–4.26
(2.79)

3.71
(5.23)

4.38
(3.15)

–3.10
(4.04)

1.85
(1.83)

–0.18
(1.82)

–4.02*
(2.22)

Market competitiveness 0.10
(0.49)

–0.92
(0.84)

–1.12
(0.77)

1.05
(1.40)

–0.15
(1.08)

0.43
(1.33)

–0.11
(0.55)

0.19
(0.48)

0.59
(0.51)

Market concentration 0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00*
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

–0.00
(0.00)

Market uncertainty –0.01
(0.02)

0.00
(0.03)

–0.00
(0.03)

0.02
(0.04)

–0.00
(0.03)

0.03
(0.03)

0.00
(0.02)

–0.01
(0.02)

–0.03
(0.02)

Mills ratio (survivorship) 1.18*
(0.66)

–1.09
(1.01)

–0.60
(0.84)

–1.21
(1.89)

1.67
(1.31)

–1.33
(1.36)

0.62
(0.62)

0.94
(0.70)

–0.16
(0.72)

CEO tenure –0.09***
(0.03)

0.04
(0.05)

0.04
(0.04)

0.10
(0.10)

–0.02
(0.06)

0.02
(0.07)

–0.01
(0.03)

–0.04
(0.03)

–0.11***
(0.04)

CEO duality 0.55*
(0.31)

–0.16
(0.47)

–0.18
(0.40)

–0.47
(0.86)

0.84
(0.59)

0.16
(0.64)

–0.01
(0.29)

0.17
(0.31)

0.45
(0.35)

CEO talent 2.45
(5.12)

0.19
(8.85)

8.66
(8.50)

30.01
(19.78)

9.42
(11.64)

11.19
(13.09)

8.72
(6.13)

3.87
(5.14)

10.68
(6.74)

CEO replacement 0.21
(0.23)

0.27
(0.35)

0.32
(0.30)

1.43**
(0.68)

0.96**
(0.44)

1.03**
(0.45)

0.37*
(0.21)

0.08
(0.25)

–0.01
(0.28)

PSCA found. 0.62**
(0.30)

–0.42
(0.47)

–0.44
(0.42)

–1.17
(0.87)

–0.08
(0.55)

–0.82
(0.63)

–0.29
(0.29)

0.46
(0.31)

0.81**
(0.36)

PSCA fam. 0.17
(0.16)

–0.07
(0.26)

–0.15
(0.21)

0.49
(0.43)

0.41
(0.38)

0.05
(0.49)

0.19
(0.21)

–0.01
(0.12)

–0.03
(0.13)

Founder involvement 0.39
(0.25)

0.88**
(0.41)

1.69***
(0.38)

1.31*
(0.73)

1.26**
(0.50)

1.07*
(0.58)

0.72***
(0.25)

0.32
(0.26)

0.46*
(0.27)

Founding family involvement –0.61**
(0.30)

–1.29*
(0.72)

–1.13**
(0.50)

–0.84
(1.02)

–0.56
(0.55)

–0.43
(0.74)

–0.29
(0.28)

–0.15
(0.30)

0.36
(0.31)

Year-indicators yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes yes

Constant –0.47
(0.43)

–2.28***
(0.70)

–3.09***
(0.70)

–5.31***
(1.73)

–2.64***
(0.87)

–4.24***
(1.33)

–1.04**
(0.41)

–0.71*
(0.43)

–1.63***
(0.46)

Observations 760 760 760 760 760 760 760 760 760

Wald χ2 64.20 20.12 36.27 16.28 29.53 22.52 61.08 46.23 36.01

Note. Robust standard errors in parentheses. ROA = returns on assets; PSCA = propensity score covariate adjustment.
*p < .1. **p < .05. ***p < .01.
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results in Table 5 support our reasoning that founder 
involvement is positively associated with the likelihood 
of initiating a broad range of restructuring actions. 
Except for Model 8, almost all the coefficients of 
founder involvement on the investigated turnaround 
responses were (at least marginally) significant and pos-
itive. However, founding family involvement was asso-
ciated with different turnaround responses compared to 
the other firms only in that they were significantly less 
likely to pursue employee retrenchment. Thus, these 
collaterals corroborate our reasoning that founding fam-
ily involvement is associated with turnaround strategies 
that particularly reflect responsibility toward employ-
ees, that is, trying to refrain from employee-related 
retrenchment actions to shield (and utilize) social capital 
endowment.

Discussion

This study provides insights into the distinct turnaround 
behavior and performance associated with founder and 
founding family involvement. With the survival of the 
firm and its social context at stake, crises such as turn-
around situations threaten the very identities of the 
founders and founding family members because the 
value and meaning of “who” they are is deeply inter-
twined with the fate of the threatened firm. Considering 
the attached personal and social obligations, the protec-
tion of their firm—and thereby the protection of their 
identity—will often remain the only viable threat 
response (Petriglieri, 2011; Toubiana, 2020). Eventually, 
such responses will have implications for organizational 
survival, employee occupation, and community wealth. 
Our work sheds light on the notable strengths and weak-
nesses resulting from founder and founding family 
involvement during turnaround situations and is relevant 
to practitioners and policymakers. From a scholarly per-
spective, it contributes to several theoretical fields.

Governance Research

The question “Does founder or founding family involve-
ment lead to superior performance?” has captivated 
entire generations of researchers. Our findings strongly 
oppose what is known about the performance implica-
tions of founder and founding family involvement in 
regular non-crisis settings, wherein superior perfor-
mance is often attributed to founder involvement (e.g., 

Miller et al., 2007). In times of crisis, the bolder turn-
around responses associated with founder involvement, 
which align with founders’ entrepreneurial identity as 
independent, opportunity-seeking, and risk-taking, 
proved particularly detrimental to turnaround perfor-
mance. Severe crises are the exception, wherein extreme 
responses become more adequate, even re-motivating, 
and their performance implications are similar to those 
of professional responses. An explanation may be that, 
under threat, founders prioritize their treasured firms’ 
existence over the needs of the stakeholders (e.g., 
employment, social coherence; Norton et al., 2012). We 
demonstrate that when bold responses are not warranted, 
such turnaround responses have particularly harmful 
repercussions, especially in older founder firms. Given 
the emerging social context and implicit contracts that 
develop since a firm’s inception, this underlines the gen-
eral importance of considering the demands of organiza-
tional stakeholders in turnaround responses (Bundy 
et al., 2017) as their weal and woe can be crucial for the 
success of a turnaround strategy (Pajunen, 2006). While 
founder involvement is positive in good times, it can be 
particularly detrimental in bad times.

Our empirical analyses are also the first to shed a dis-
tinct light on the unique crisis strategy associated with 
founding family involvement—a void in management 
research that scholars are repeatedly urged to address 
(King et al., 2022; Trahms et al., 2013). Indeed, this cri-
sis strategy appears to reflect the caring and nurturing 
familial identities of those who govern and the distinct 
prioritization of responsibility toward their employees 
(Habbershon & Williams, 1999). We observe that found-
ing family involvement leads to turnaround strategies 
that advocate trading the short-term financial benefits of 
employee retrenchment for the benefits of employee 
retention, for example, in the form of superior stake-
holder coherence. Because both effects partly offset 
each other, this may explain why the performance impli-
cations of founding family involvement are generally 
comparable to those of firms without founder and found-
ing family involvement in times of crisis. In addition, in 
our sample, founding family involvement co-occurred 
with founder involvement or as lone founding family 
member involvement in many cases, such that the mean-
ings of familial identity may not completely apply but 
blend with an entrepreneurial identity. However, in the 
sub-case of a prototypical and unblended familial iden-
tity, that is, when multiple founding family members 
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(but no founder) are involved, who mutually endorse 
and reinforce each other’s familial identity, we observe 
that turnaround performance exceeds the performance 
of firms without such involvement. This observation 
informs the study of family firm heterogeneity (Neubaum 
et al., 2019), as it suggests that the involvement of mul-
tiple founding family members without founder interfer-
ence differs in terms of leader behavior from cases 
where only a single founding family member (and no 
founder) is involved (Miller et  al., 2011; Miller & Le 
Breton-Miller, 2011).

Notably, turnaround responses associated with found-
ing family involvement may be considered more 
“responsible” than other firms because of their reluc-
tance to engage in employee retrenchment (Cascio, 
2002). More importantly, as turnaround situations 
become more severe or when firm age increases, found-
ing family involvement increases firm’s resilience (cf., 
Lins et  al., 2017) and overperformance. Firms with 
founding family involvement seem able to capitalize on 
the unique advantages of their evolved social capital 
endowment, making them particularly resilient in times 
of crisis (Aldrich & Meyer, 2015). Thus, beyond under-
lining the necessity of adapting turnaround responses to 
the social context in which firms operate, our findings 
highlight the need for family firm leaders to consider 
their firms’ social capital endowment as a unique com-
petitive advantage in turnaround situations (Brewton 
et al., 2010; Zahra, 2010; Zellweger et al., 2019).

Therefore, this study constitutes an indirect test of a 
central conjecture in the governance literature: the 
assumption that continued founding family involvement 
facilitates the opportunity to garner and rely on emer-
gent social capital resources as a unique performance 
driver (Ahrens et  al., 2019; Lins et  al., 2017; Pearson 
et al., 2008). Our results imply that social capital that is 
nurtured by previous generations can be transferred 
across family generations to ultimately constitute a per-
formance advantage (Ahrens et  al., 2019). Taken 
together, these insights pave the way to an overarching 
family firm theory that explains the synergies between 
family and business from an evolutionary perspective 
(Dyer et al., 2014).

Finally, the evidence presented has implications for 
the debate on component- and essence-based approaches 
in family business theory. Chua et al. (1999) suggest that 
component approaches (e.g., relying on the CEO, board, 
or ownership involvement of the founding family) fail to 

capture the essence of the family firm, especially the 
intention to pursue a vision that is potentially intergen-
erationally sustainable across family generations. They 
suggest that components of involvement are weak deter-
minants of family firm behavior. Conversely, we find 
that the use of fine-grained components strongly pre-
dicts firm behavior in crises. Our study suggests that 
components of involvement can, to a large extent, over-
come intention issues (Chua et  al., 1999), especially 
when components adequately capture family firm het-
erogeneity (Neubaum et  al., 2019) and are delineated 
using theoretical guidance from family firm research 
(Miller et al., 2011; Miller & Le Breton-Miller, 2011).

Research on Identity Threat

Our work suggests that responses to identity threats—an 
understudied phenomenon—can have both positive and 
negative organizational consequences. Therefore, we 
contribute to the current understanding of the conse-
quences of identity threats (J. L. Petriglieri, 2011).  
While extant research has particularly emphasized the 
negative consequences of identity threats (Blanz et al., 
1998; Breakwell, 1986), we show that individual-level 
identity threats (e.g., the prospect of losing the role of a 
family firm matriarch or patriarch), while imposing psy-
chological strain on the leaders themselves (Lazarus & 
Folkman, 1984), can lead to positive collective out-
comes. This is documented by the superior turnaround 
performance associated with founding family involve-
ment in cases of high turnaround severity or firm matu-
rity, as well as by the evidence of multiple founding 
family involvement cases. Thus, what is problematic for 
firm leaders themselves may not necessarily be detri-
mental for their firm; in fact, the effects can be opposite 
in direction. In this regard, our work facilitates a more 
differentiated understanding of how individual identity 
threats relate to organizational phenomena.

Considering the evolution of a firm’s social context 
with firm age, our work further suggests that the organi-
zational-level impact of identity threat responses is fun-
damentally shaped by a firm’s social context and that the 
consonance (or conflict) of the threat response with the 
expectations of the firm’s social context triggers a ben-
eficial (or detrimental) echo. Thus, mirroring research 
on the construction of identities, scholars need to go 
beyond the individual to fully understand the conse-
quences of individual identity threats. There is a need to 
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study an individual in his or her social context, particu-
larly, the (emergent) structures, norms, and constella-
tions of expectations and obligations that inter alia mark 
this context (Asch, 1952; Simmel, 1895; Thibaut & 
Kelley, 1959).

Theories on the Conceptualization of 
Identities

Foundational research has conceptualized identity as 
static and driven by the psychological desire for stability 
of the self (e.g., James, 1890; Strauss, 1959). More 
recently, management researchers have ignited an ongo-
ing debate about whether identity should be seen as a 
more dynamic concept and have examined when and 
how leader identities change (Ashforth, 2000; Ibarra, 
1999). Scholars have argued that individuals can 
“enrich” their identities over time by incorporating 
experiences and feedback gained from social interaction 
(Pratt et al., 2006, p. 256). Similarly, they propose that 
“leaders’ identities tend to shift from individual to more 
collective orientations as their expertise develops” (Day 
& Harrison, 2007; Ibarra et al., 2014; Lord & Hall, 2005, 
p. 592). Notably, at least under threat, our results pro-
vide a strong indication that individuals maintain a his-
torical, valued “core identity,” which they “fall back” on 
in times of crises. This raises questions regarding how 
much value individuals attach to the gradual enrichment 
of their identity and how durable or persistent those 
enrichments are under threat. Consequently, the tight 
coupling between social context and identity suggested 
by existing literature may be much looser and entail dys-
functionalities. In the face of an evolving social context, 
this nuance has considerable practical implications. In 
our study, it is particularly visible in cases where the 
founder’s entrepreneurial “core” identity does not grasp 
the increasing obligations to organizational stakeholders 
in times of crisis. Crisis performance suffers when 
founders’ actions are out of step with their firms’ social 
contexts.

On a trans-generational level (i.e., between firm 
founders and founder descendants), our results confirm 
a (core-)identity adoption toward more collective orien-
tations. In fact, a potentially detrimental “ossification” 
of a core identity (the founder involvement case) can be 
broken at a trans-generational level between the founder 
and the next family generation: The identities of incom-
ing family members appear to better reflect the evolving 

social context of the firm, especially—as our indicative 
collateral analyses suggest—when multiple family 
members are also involved in the firm. From an evolu-
tionary and conceptual perspective, this suggests that 
the adoption and adaptive mutation of leader identities 
occur mainly between (family) generations and in 
response to the evolving social context to which the 
identities of incoming leaders relate (Ashforth, 2000).

This insight carries normative implications for 
research on leader prototypicality (Ibarra et al., 2014). 
On the one hand, it suggests that as the social context 
surrounding the firm evolves, so do stakeholders’ expec-
tations of what constitutes prototypical behavior (Lord 
& Hall, 2005). On the other hand, even in very severe 
turnaround situations, the concept of prototypical behav-
ior as a determinant of ultimate effectiveness appears 
valid (e.g., Giessner & van Knippenberg, 2008). We 
document that orienting a firm’s turnaround strategy 
toward the collective good of the social context sur-
rounding the firm benefits turnaround performance in 
case of abundant social capital (Fu et al., 2010).

Theories of the Firm

Our study of founder and founding family involvement 
in turnaround situations reinforces identity as a “root 
construct” (Albert et  al., 2000, p. 13) in management 
research because it shapes strategic action and firm per-
formance (Hambrick & Mason, 1984; March & Simon, 
1958). Similarly, it places the social individual at the 
helm of a firm and as a critical unit of analysis (Asch, 
1952) by portraying them in reciprocal relation to an 
emergent social context, its inherent norms, and the con-
stellations of expectations, obligations, and shared sche-
mata (Thibaut & Kelley, 1959). This perspective holds 
several important implications for the theory of the firm. 
First, it goes beyond the notion of agency theory, which 
debates the unique performance consequences of 
founder and family involvement in ownership and man-
agement from opposing viewpoints (Miller et al., 2011). 
Some scholars argue that such firms overperform due to 
resolved Type I agency conflicts (avoiding monitoring 
costs by reconciling incentives) (Jensen & Meckling, 
1976), while others note that they are prone to Type II 
agency conflicts (seizing private benefits of control at 
the expense of minority owners) and underperform 
(Morck et al., 2005). An identity perspective contributes 
a reconciliatory theoretical explanation by emphasizing 
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that it is the social individual’s identity (i.e., those exert-
ing influence on the firm) that may elicit performance 
effects. Correspondingly, one may look beyond the 
question of whether agency conflicts are resolved and 
consider how influential individuals socially construct 
their selves and elicit performance effects (Miller et al., 
2011).

Second, by incorporating how social forces affect the 
precedence of specific courses of action at the individual 
level, our findings may complement frameworks that 
consider an individual-centric approach to predicting 
organizational phenomena (Hambrick & Mason, 1984). 
For example, upper echelons theory posits that the per-
sonal characteristics, values, and preferences of those at 
the firm’s helm affect organizational outcomes 
(Hambrick & Mason, 1984). It seems logical to extend 
this framework by acknowledging the interference of a 
social dimension, namely, an individual’s identity 
(Stryker, 1987; Tajfel, 1974); however, this has remained 
overlooked thus far. Notably, such a theoretical exten-
sion would fit flawlessly into the upper echelons theo-
ry’s well-understood mechanics, as individuals derive 
considerable degrees of self-esteem and self-efficacy 
from their identities (Gecas, 1982; J. L. Petriglieri, 
2011), making it a key element of personal preference.

Finally, we call for a widening of the lens beyond the 
individual level to one that also encompasses the group 
level when explaining a firm’s behavior and perfor-
mance, to better understand how organizational evolu-
tion alters social contexts, and therefore, assumed leader 
identities, both of which conjointly determine (the het-
erogeneity of) organizational trajectories (Carroll, 1984; 
Ekeh, 1974; Long, 2011). By adopting such a perspec-
tive, one may begin to understand why the established 
wisdom that firms with founder involvement are associ-
ated with positive effects on firm performance (Adams 
et  al., 2009; Bennedsen et  al., 2007; Carroll, 1984; 
Morck et al., 1988; Villalonga & Amit, 2006) does not 
apply to the crisis context, where founder behavior 
(individual level) may conflict with the expectations of 
the firm’s social context (group level).

Practical Implications

In crisis situations, the way out is often hidden, obscure, 
and ambiguous. Our work debunks some of the mystery 
surrounding turnaround management by facilitating our 

understanding of the turnaround management of firms 
with founder and founding family involvement—the 
most predominant governance context worldwide 
(Faccio & Lang, 2002; La Porta et al., 1999). In particu-
lar, we shed light on the distinct turnaround strategies 
associated with founder and founding family involve-
ment, and the benefits and detriments of their involve-
ment in their firms’ turnaround performance. Enabling 
reflection on these coherences helps firm leaders, own-
ers, boards, entrepreneurial families, and policymakers 
respond to existential crises more adequately and make 
economies more robust.

In this regard, CEOs, board members, and owners 
may follow our rationale and consider the social con-
text of a firm when designing the most-effective turn-
around measures. The distinct crisis responses in Table 
5 are particularly insightful for practitioners in this 
respect. Decision-makers in mature family firm con-
texts, in particular, should double-check if layoffs or 
new wage agreements, or more employee-related 
retrenchment in general, are really necessary; or per-
haps a more “responsible” crisis strategy can avoid or 
reduce such measures and the damage they inflict on 
the firm’s social capital and social structure (Cascio, 
2002).

Another key takeaway is that “taming the founder” 
can become a major objective in turnaround situations 
as founders tend to advocate overly “bold” turnaround 
responses (Table 5). This objective is nontrivial when an 
endowment of ownership or the duality of CEO and 
chairman furthers the founder’s power. Yet our analyses 
suggest that offering an intergenerational perspective to 
the founder, via the inclusion of founding family 
involvement, may contribute to such a “taming” by 
blending their entrepreneurial identity with the mean-
ings of familial identity. Indeed, the collateral analysis 
in Table 4 suggests that when the founder’s involvement 
is coupled with that of the founding family, the perfor-
mance effects may no longer be significantly negative. 
For practitioners (and advisors), it may thus be helpful 
to emphasize a long-run family perspective that respects 
and includes the voice of the next generation in the 
boardroom and in decision-making, particularly in 
mature firms. Moreover, for post-founder entrepreneur-
ial families, our work suggests that during crises, the 
involvement of multiple founding family members may 
be advantageous. Assuming this to be true, asking for 
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familial support might be wise, and familial identity 
may be reinforced in such a constellation, which signals 
reassuring commitment to the firm and its stakeholders. 
Finally, targeted one-day family firm crisis-management 
seminars that link topics of retrenchment and recovery 
with management for the long run, social capital, and 
responsibility are conceivable flanking measures. They 
could not only spark self-reflective cognitive processes 
in founders but also hone crisis-management skills in 
the board and family.

Limitations and Future Research

Future research may wish to go beyond publicly traded 
organizations and apply our framework to private 
firms. The artifacts of various constellations of founder 
and founding family involvement could reveal effects 
of considerable magnitude in the highly professional, 
normed, and regulated setting of S&P 1,500 firms. 
Presumably, these effects on organizational trajectories 
are even more pronounced in unregulated and less-
controlled settings, such as private or small- and 
medium-sized companies. In addition, the S&P 1,500 
environment implies a limited number of cases within 
the sub-categories across the landscape of heteroge-
neous constellations of family and founding family 
involvement. Although this limitation of our collateral 
analyses is inevitable, as turnaround cases rarely occur, 
it could be overcome by future turnaround research 
that targets family firm heterogeneity using potentially 
larger samples of a private firm environment to inquire 
into the full spectrum of family firm heterogeneity. In 
addition, the greater variation in such a bigger private 
firm sample could provide more means to overcome 
the limitation of this study that founder as well as 
founding family involvement and the moderator firm 
age are for natural reasons, to some degree, related. 
Moreover, although we have several selection and 
firm-level controls in place, all firms, wherein there is 
post-founder founding family involvement, have argu-
ably survived a family succession process at least once 
and, thus, possess what could be called “intergenera-
tional survivability.” This is an aspect that we might be 
capturing incompletely and could be a limitation of 
this study. While a deeper inquiry into this issue is 
beyond the scope of this work, obtaining a better 
understanding of survivability between generations 
(and how it is linked to crisis behavior) remains a key 

challenge for future family firm research. As is often 
seen in leadership research (Hambrick & Mason, 
1984), this study relies on an unobtrusive empirical 
approach that utilizes multiple proxy variables from 
external sources because of the inherent difficulty of 
observing overarching constructs (i.e., identity) 
directly at the individual level. Therefore, we encour-
age future research to measure leader identity through 
a finer lens, for example, in interviews across private 
firms, via its three related elements of individual inter-
nalization, relational recognition, and collective 
endorsement (DeRue & Ashford, 2010). Ideally, this 
should capture both the components and the essence of 
a family firm and explore their impact on crisis behav-
ior and outcomes.

Acknowledgments

The authors thank Franz Kellermanns, Danny Miller, Isabelle 
Le Breton-Miller, Sue Ashford, Donald Neubaum, Keith 
Brigham, Michael Woywode, and Max Strothenke for their 
helpful contributions. The authors would also like to thank the 
anonymous reviewers. Jan-Philipp Ahrens and Marc 
Kowalzick share the first authorship for this work. This work 
holds best article nominations from: 9th Annual Conference of 
German Family Business Research Institutes (2019), 24th 
Interdisciplinary Annual Conference on Entrepreneurship, 
Innovation, and Mittelstand (2020), and the European 
Academy of Management (EURAM), 20th Annual Conference 
(2020) where it was nominated for the EURAM conference 
overall award. It also holds the following best article awards: 
18th Interdisciplinary European Conference on 
Entrepreneurship Research (IECER) (2020) and European 
Academy of Management, 20th Annual Conference (2020), 
Best Article of the Family Business Research Strategic Interest 
Group.

Author’s Note

Marc Kowalzick is also currently affiliated with Erasmus 
University in Rotterdam, the Netherlands.

Declaration of Conflicting Interests

The author(s) declared no potential conflicts of interest with 
respect to the research, authorship, and/or publication of this 
article.

Funding

The author(s) received no financial support for the research, 
authorship, and/or publication of this article.



28	 Family Business Review 38(1)

ORCID iDs

Jan-Philipp Ahrens  https://orcid.org/0000-0003-1866- 
7068
Marc Kowalzick  https://orcid.org/0000-0002-7522-2359

References

Adams, R., Almeida, H., & Ferreira, D. (2009). Understanding 
the relationship between founder–CEOs and firm perfor-
mance. Journal of Empirical Finance, 16(1), 136–150.

Adler, P. S., & Kwon, S.-W. (2002). Social capital: Prospects 
for a new concept. Academy of Management Review, 
27(1), 17–40.

Ahrens, J.-P., Calabrò, A., Huybrechts, J., & Woywode, M. 
(2019). The enigma of family successor performance: 
A methodological reflection and reconciliation attempt. 
Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 43(3), 437–474.

Albert, S., Ashforth, B. E., & Dutton, J. E. (2000). 
Organizational identity and identification: Charting new 
waters and building new bridges. Academy of Management 
Review, 25(1), 13–17.

Aldrich, D. P., & Meyer, M. A. (2015). Social capital and 
community resilience. American Behavioral Scientist, 
59(2), 254–269.

Altman, E. I. (1968). Financial ratios, discriminant analysis 
and the prediction of corporate bankruptcy. The Journal 
of Finance, 23(4), 589–609.

Alvarez, S. A., & Busenitz, L. W. (2001). The entrepreneur-
ship of resource-based theory. Journal of Management, 
27(6), 755–775.

Anderson, R. C., & Reeb, D. M. (2003). Founding-family 
ownership and firm performance: Evidence from the S&P 
500. The Journal of Finance, 58(3), 1301–1328.

Ang, J. S., Cole, R. A., & Lin, J. W. (2000). Agency costs 
and ownership structure. The Journal of Finance, 55(1), 
81–106.

Arogyaswamy, K., Barker, V. L., & Yasai-Ardekani, M. 
(1995). Firm turnarounds: An integrative two-stage 
model. Journal of Management Studies, 32(4), 493–525.

Arregle, J.-L., Hitt, M. A., Sirmon, D. G., & Very, P. 
(2007). The development of organizational social capi-
tal: Attributes of family firms. Journal of Management 
Studies, 44(1), 73–95.

Asch, S. E. (1952). Social psychology. Prentice-Hall.
Ashforth, B. E. (2000). Role transitions in organizational life: 

An identity-based perspective. Routledge.
Audia, P. G., & Greve, H. R. (2006). Less likely to fail: Low 

performance, firm size, and factory expansion in the ship-
building industry. Management Science, 52(1), 83–94.

Barber, B. M., & Lyon, J. D. (1996). Detecting abnormal oper-
ating performance: The empirical power and specification 
of test statistics. Journal of Financial Economics, 41(3), 
359–399.

Barker, V. L., & Duhaime, I. M. (1997). Strategic change in 
the turnaround process: Theory and empirical evidence. 
Strategic Management Journal, 18(1), 13–38.

Baumeister, R. F. (1989). Motives and costs of self-presenta-
tion in organizations. In R. A. Giacalone & P. Rosenfeld 
(Eds.), Impression management in the organization (pp. 
57–71). Lawrence Erlbaum.

Belsley, D. A., Kuh, E., & Welsch, R. E. (2005). Regression 
diagnostics: Identifying influential data and sources of 
collinearity. John Wiley & Sons.

Bennedsen, M., Nielsen, K. M., Perez-Gonzalez, F., & 
Wolfenzon, D. (2007). Inside the family firm: The role 
of families in succession decisions and performance. The 
Quarterly Journal of Economics, 122(2), 647–691.

Bhagat, S., Moyen, N., & Suh, I. (2005). Investment and 
internal funds of distressed firms. Journal of Corporate 
Finance, 11(3), 449–472.

Bibeault, D. B. (1982). Corporate turnaround: How managers 
turn losers into winners. McGraw-Hill.

Blanz, M., Mummendey, A., Mielke, R., & Klink, A. (1998). 
Responding to negative social identity: A taxonomy of 
identity management strategies. European Journal of 
Social Psychology, 28(5), 697–729.

Block, J. (2010). Family management, family ownership, 
and downsizing: Evidence from S&P 500 firms. Family 
Business Review, 23(2), 109–130.

Bono, J. E., & Ilies, R. (2006). Charisma, positive emotions 
and mood contagion. The Leadership Quarterly, 17(4), 
317–334.

Bono, J. E., & Judge, T. A. (2003). Self-concordance at work: 
Toward understanding the motivational effects of trans-
formational leaders. Academy of Management Journal, 
46(5), 554–571.

Boyne, G. A., & Meier, K. J. (2009). Environmental change, 
human resources and organizational turnaround. Journal 
of Management Studies, 46(5), 835–863.

Breakwell, G. M. (1986). Coping with threatened identities. 
Methuen.

Breusch, T. S., & Pagan, A. R. (1980). The Lagrange multiplier 
test and its applications to model specification in econo-
metrics. The Review of Economic Studies, 47(1), 239–253.

Brewer, M. B., & Gardner, W. (1996). Who is this “we”? Levels 
of collective identity and self representations. Journal of 
Personality and Social Psychology, 71(1), 83–93.

Brewton, K. E., Danes, S. M., Stafford, K., & Haynes, G. 
W. (2010). Determinants of rural and urban family firm 
resilience. Journal of Family Business Strategy, 1(3), 
155–166.

Brickley, J. A. (2003). Empirical research on CEO turn-
over and firm-performance: A discussion. Journal of 
Accounting and Economics, 36(1-3), 227–233.

Bundy, J., Pfarrer, M. D., Short, C. E., & Coombs, W. T. 
(2017). Crises and crisis management: Integration, 

https://orcid.org/0000-0003-1866-7068
https://orcid.org/0000-0003-1866-7068
https://orcid.org/0000-0002-7522-2359


Ahrens et al.	 29

interpretation, and research development. Journal of 
Management, 43(6), 1661–1692.

Calabrò, A., Minichilli, A., Amore, M. D., & Brogi, M. (2018). 
The courage to choose! Primogeniture and leadership suc-
cession in family firms. Strategic Management Journal, 
39(7), 2014–2035.

Cannella, A. A., Jones, C. D., & Withers, M. C. (2015). 
Family-versus lone-founder-controlled public corpora-
tions: Social identity theory and boards of directors. 
Academy of Management Journal, 58(2), 436–459.

Carhart, M. M. (1997). On persistence in mutual fund perfor-
mance. The Journal of Finance, 52(1), 57–82.

Carr, J. C., Cole, M. S., Ring, J. K., & Blettner, D. P. (2011). 
A measure of variations in internal social capital among 
family firms. Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 
35(6), 1207–1227.

Carroll, G. R. (1984). Dynamics of publisher succession 
in newspaper organizations. Administrative Science 
Quarterly, 29(1), 93–113.

Cascio, W. F. (2002). Strategies for responsible restructuring. 
Academy of Management Executive, 16(3), 80–91.

Cast, A. D., Stets, J. E., & Burke, P. J. (1999). Does the 
self conform to the views of others? Social Psychology 
Quarterly, 62(1), 68–82.

Cater, J., & Schwab, A. (2008). Turnaround strategies in 
established small family firms. Family Business Review, 
21(1), 31–50.

Certo, S. T., Busenbark, J. R., Woo, H., & Semadeni, M. 
(2016). Sample selection bias and Heckman models in 
strategic management research. Strategic Management 
Journal, 37(13), 2639–2657.

Chatterjee, A., & Hambrick, D. C. (2007). It’s all about me: 
Narcissistic chief executive officers and their effects 
on company strategy and performance. Administrative 
Science Quarterly, 52(3), 351–386.

Chen, G., & Hambrick, D. C. (2012). CEO replacement in turn-
around situations: Executive (mis)fit and its performance 
implications. Organization Science, 23(1), 225–243.

Chrisman, J. J., Chua, J. H., Pearson, A. W., & Barnett, T. 
(2012). Family involvement, family influence, and 
family-centered non-economic goals in small firms. 
Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 36(2), 267–293.

Chua, J. H., Chrisman, J. J., & Sharma, P. (1999). Defining the 
family business by behavior. Entrepreneurship Theory 
and Practice, 23(4), 19–39.

Cochran, P. L., & Wood, R. A. (1984). Corporate social 
responsibility and financial performance. Academy of 
Management Journal, 27(1), 42–56.

Coleman, J. S. (1990). Foundations of social theory. Harvard 
University Press.

Crocker, J., & Major, B. (1989). Social stigma and self-esteem: 
The self-protective properties of stigma. Psychological 
Review, 96(4), 608–630.

Crossland, C., Zyung, J., Hiller, N. J., & Hambrick, D. C. 
(2014). CEO career variety: Effects on firm-level strate-
gic and social novelty. Academy of Management Journal, 
57(3), 652–674.

Cyert, R. M., & March, J. G. (1963). A behavioral theory of 
the firm. Prentice-Hall.

D’Aveni, R. A. (1989). The aftermath of organizational 
decline: A longitudinal study of the strategic and mana-
gerial characteristics of declining firms. Academy of 
Management Journal, 32(3), 577–605.

Davis, H. Z., & Peles, Y. C. (1993). Measuring equilibrating 
forces of financial ratios. The Accounting Review, 68(4), 
725–747.

Davis, J. L., Fama, E. F., & French, K. R. (2000). 
Characteristics, covariances, and average returns: 1929 to 
1997. The Journal of Finance, 55(1), 389–406.

Day, D. V., & Harrison, M. M. (2007). A Multilevel, iden-
tity-based approach to leadership development. Human 
Resource Management Review, 17(4), 360–373.

Demerjian, P., Lev, B., & McVay, S. (2012). Quantifying 
managerial ability: A new measure and validity tests. 
Management Science, 58(7), 1229–1248.

DeRue, D. S., & Ashford, S. J. (2010). Who will lead and 
who will follow? A social process of leadership identity 
construction in organizations. Academy of Management 
Review, 35(4), 627–647.

Dess, G. G., & Beard, D. W. (1984). Dimensions of orga-
nizational task environments. Administrative Science 
Quarterly, 29(1), 52–73.

Dobrev, S. D., & Barnett, W. P. (2005). Organizational 
roles and transition to entrepreneurship. Academy of 
Management Journal, 48(3), 433–449.

Dyer, W. G., Nenque, E., & Hill, E. J. (2014). Toward a theory 
of family capital and entrepreneurship: Antecedents and 
outcomes. Journal of Small Business Management, 52(2), 
266–285.

Ekeh, P. P. (1974). Social exchange theory: The two tradi-
tions. Harvard University Press.

Elze, M. C., Gregson, J., Baber, U., Williamson, E., Sartori, 
S., Mehran, R., Nichols, M., Stone, G. W., & Pocock, S. 
J. (2017). Comparison of propensity score methods and 
covariate adjustment: Evaluation in 4 cardiovascular 
studies. Journal of the American College of Cardiology, 
69(3), 345–357.

Faccio, M., & Lang, L. H. (2002). The ultimate ownership 
of Western European corporations. Journal of Financial 
Economics, 65(3), 365–395.

Fama, E. F., & French, K. R. (1993). Common risk factors 
in the returns on stocks and bonds. Journal of Financial 
Economics, 33(1), 3–56.

Fama, E. F., & French, K. R. (2015). A five-factor asset  
pricing model. Journal of Financial Economics, 116(1), 
1–22.



30	 Family Business Review 38(1)

Fama, E. F., & French, K. R. (2018). Choosing factors. Journal 
of Financial Economics, 128(2), 234–252.

Ferrier, W. J. (2001). Navigating the competitive landscape: 
The drivers and consequences of competitive aggressive-
ness. Academy of Management Journal, 44(4), 858–877.

Ford, J. D., Ford, L. W., & D’Amelio, A. (2008). Resistance 
to change: The rest of the story. Academy of Management 
Review, 33(2), 362–377.

Freeman, J., Carroll, G. R., & Hannan, M. T. (1983). The lia-
bility of newness: Age dependence in organizational death 
rates. American Sociological Review, 48(5), 692–710.

Fu, P. P., Tsui, A. S., Liu, J., & Li, L. (2010). Pursuit of whose 
happiness? Executive leaders’ transformational behaviors 
and personal values. Administrative Science Quarterly, 
55(2), 222–254.

Gartner, W. B. (1988). “Who is an entrepreneur?” Is the wrong 
question. Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 12(4), 
11–32.

Garvey, G. T., & Milbourn, T. T. (2006). Asymmetric bench-
marking in compensation: Executives are rewarded for 
good luck but not penalized for bad. Journal of Financial 
Economics, 82(1), 197–225.

Gecas, V. (1982). The self-concept. Annual Review of 
Sociology, 8(1), 1–33.

Gersick, K. E., Davis, J. A., Hampton, M. M., & Lansberg, I. 
(1997). Generation to generation: Life cycles of the family 
business. Harvard Business Review Press.

Gerstner, W.-C., König, A., Enders, A., & Hambrick, D. C. 
(2013). CEO narcissism, audience engagement, and 
organizational adoption of technological discontinuities. 
Administrative Science Quarterly, 58(2), 257–291.

Giessner, S. R., & van Knippenberg, D. (2008). “License to 
fail”: Goal definition, leader group prototypicality, and 
perceptions of leadership effectiveness after leader failure. 
Organizational Behavior and Human Decision Processes, 
105(1), 14–35.

Gouldner, A. W. (1960). The norm of reciprocity: A prelimi-
nary statement. American Sociological Review, 25(2), 
161–178.

Greenwood, R., & Schor, M. (2009). Investor activism  
and takeovers. Journal of Financial Economics, 92(3), 
362–375.

Greif, A. (1989). Reputation and coalitions in medieval 
trade: Evidence on the Maghribi traders. The Journal of 
Economic History, 49(4), 857–882.

Habbershon, T. G., & Williams, M. L. (1999). A resource-
based framework for assessing the strategic advantages of 
family firms. Family Business Review, 12(1), 1–25.

Hambrick, D. C., & Finkelstein, S. (1987). Managerial discre-
tion: A bridge between polar views of organizational out-
comes. Research in Organizational Behavior, 9, 369–406.

Hambrick, D. C., & Mason, P. A. (1984). Upper echelons: The 
organization as a reflection of its top managers. Academy 
of Management Review, 9(2), 193–206.

Hambrick, D. C., & Schecter, S. M. (1983). Turnaround 
strategies for mature industrial-product business units. 
Academy of Management Journal, 26(2), 231–248.

Heckman, J. J. (1976). The common structure of statisti-
cal models of truncation, sample selection and limited 
dependent variables and a simple estimator for such mod-
els. Annals of Economic and Social Measurement, 5(4), 
475–492.

Heckman, J. J. (1979). Sample selection bias as a specification 
error. Econometrica, 47(1), 153–161.

Helliwell, J. F., Huang, H., & Wang, S. (2014). Social capital 
and well-being in times of crisis. Journal of Happiness 
Studies, 15(1), 145–162.

Hillier, D., & McColgan, P. (2009). Firm performance and 
managerial succession in family managed firms. Journal 
of Business Finance & Accounting, 36(3-4), 461–484.

Hofer, C. W. (1980). Turnaround strategies. Journal of 
Business Strategy, 1(1), 19–31.

Hoffman, J., Hoelscher, M., & Sorenson, R. (2006). Achieving 
sustained competitive advantage: A family capital theory. 
Family Business Review, 19(2), 135–145.

Huber, P. J. (1967). The behavior of maximum likelihood esti-
mates under nonstandard conditions. Proceedings of the 
Fifth Berkeley Symposium on Mathematical Statistics and 
Probability, 1, 221–233.

Huson, M. R., Malatesta, P. H., & Parrino, R. (2004). 
Managerial succession and firm performance. Journal of 
Financial Economics, 74(2), 237–275.

Ibarra, H. (1999). Provisional selves: Experimenting 
with i-mage and identity in professional adaptation. 
Administrative Science Quarterly, 44(4), 764–791.

Ibarra, H., Wittman, S., Petriglieri, G., & Day, D. V. (2014). 
Leadership and identity: An examination of three theo-
ries and new research directions. In D. V. Day (Ed.), The 
Oxford handbook of leadership and organizations (pp. 
285–300). Oxford University Press.

James, W. (1890). The principles of psychology. Holt.
Jensen, M. C., & Meckling, W. H. (1976). Theory of the firm: 

Managerial behavior, agency costs and ownership struc-
ture. Journal of Financial Economics, 3(4), 305–360.

Karpoff, J. M., Schonlau, R. J., & Wehrly, E. W. (2017). Do 
takeover defense indices measure takeover deterrence? 
The Review of Financial Studies, 30(7), 2359–2412.

Keats, B. W., & Hitt, M. A. (1988). A causal model of link-
ages among environmental dimensions, macro organi-
zational characteristics, and performance. Academy of 
Management Journal, 31(3), 570–598.

King, D. R., Meglio, O., Gomez-Mejia, L., Bauer, F., & de 
Massis, A. (2022). Family business restructuring: A 
review and research agenda. Journal of Management 
Studies, 59(1), 197–235.

Krishnan, R., Martin, X., & Noorderhaven, N. G. (2006). 
When does trust matter to alliance performance? Academy 
of Management Journal, 49(5), 894–917.



Ahrens et al.	 31

La Porta, R., Lopez-De-Silanes, F., & Shleifer, A. (1999). 
Corporate ownership around the world. The Journal of 
Finance, 54(2), 471–517.

Lazarus, R. S., & Folkman, S. (1984). Stress, appraisal, and 
coping. Springer.

Li, J., & Tang, Y. (2010). CEO hubris and firm risk taking 
in China: The moderating role of managerial discretion. 
Academy of Management Journal, 53(1), 45–68.

Liang, K.-Y., & Zeger, S. L. (1986). Longitudinal data analy-
sis using generalized linear models. Biometrika, 73(1), 
13–22.

Lindström, M., & Giordano, G. N. (2016). The 2008 financial 
crisis: Changes in social capital and its association with 
psychological wellbeing in the United Kingdom: A panel 
study. Social Science & Medicine, 153, 71–80.

Lins, K. V., Servaes, H., & Tamayo, A. (2017). Social capital, 
trust, and firm performance: The value of corporate social 
responsibility during the financial crisis. The Journal of 
Finance, 72(4), 1785–1824.

Long, R. G. (2011). Commentary: Social exchange in build-
ing, modeling, and managing family social capital. 
Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 35(6), 1229–
1234.

Lord, R. G., & Hall, R. J. (2005). Identity, deep structure 
and the development of leadership skill. The Leadership 
Quarterly, 16(4), 591–615.

Love, E. G., & Nohria, N. (2005). Reducing slack: The per-
formance consequences of downsizing by large industrial 
firms, 1977–93. Strategic Management Journal, 26(12), 
1087–1108.

Malmendier, U., Tate, G., & Yan, J. (2011). Overconfidence 
and early-life experiences: The effect of managerial traits 
on corporate financial policies. The Journal of Finance, 
66(5), 1687–1733.

March, J. G., & Simon, H. A. (1958). Organizations. John 
Wiley & Sons.

Markus, H., & Wurf, E. (1987). The dynamic self-concept: 
A social psychological perspective. Annual Review of 
Psychology, 38(1), 299–337.

Miller, D., & Le Breton-Miller, I. (2005). Managing for the 
long run: Lessons in competitive advantage from great 
family businesses. Harvard Business School Press.

Miller, D., & Le Breton-Miller, I. (2011). Governance, social 
identity, and entrepreneurial orientation in closely held 
public companies. Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 
35(5), 1051–1076.

Miller, D., Le Breton-Miller, I., & Lester, R. H. (2011). Family 
and lone founder ownership and strategic behaviour: 
Social context, identity, and institutional logics. Journal 
of Management Studies, 48(1), 1–25.

Miller, D., Le Breton-Miller, I., Lester, R. H., & Cannella, A. 
A. (2007). Are family firms really superior performers? 
Journal of Corporate Finance, 13(5), 829–858.

Morck, R., Shleifer, A., & Vishny, R. W. (1988). Management 
ownership and market valuation: An empirical analysis. 
Journal of Financial Economics, 20, 293–315.

Morck, R., Wolfenzon, D., & Yeung, B. (2005). Corporate 
governance, economic entrenchment, and growth. Journal 
of Economic Literature, 43(3), 655–720.

Morrow, J. L., Johnson, R. A., & Busenitz, L. W. (2004). The 
effects of cost and asset retrenchment on firm perfor-
mance: The overlooked role of a firm’s competitive envi-
ronment. Journal of Management, 30(2), 189–208.

Nahapiet, J., & Ghoshal, S. (1998). Social capital, intellectual 
capital, and the organizational advantage. Academy of 
Management Review, 23(2), 242–266.

Nelson, R. E. (1989). The strength of strong ties: Social net-
works and intergroup conflict in organization. Academy of 
Management Journal, 32(2), 377–401.

Neubaum, D. O., Kammerlander, N., & Brigham, K. H. 
(2019). Capturing family firm heterogeneity: How tax-
onomies and typologies can help the field move forward. 
Family Business Review, 32(2), 106–130.

Norton, M. I., Mochon, D., & Ariely, D. (2012). The IKEA 
effect: When labor leads to love. Journal of Consumer 
Psychology, 22(3), 453–460.

O’Brien, R. M. (2007). A caution regarding rules of thumb 
for variance inflation factors. Quality & Quantity, 41(5), 
673–690.

Olson, M. (1968). The logic of collective action. Schocken 
Books.

Pajunen, K. (2006). Stakeholder influences in organizational 
survival. Journal of Management Studies, 43(6), 1261–
1288.

Palmer, T. B., & Wiseman, R. M. (1999). Decoupling risk tak-
ing from income stream uncertainty: A holistic model of 
risk. Strategic Management Journal, 20(11), 1037–1062.

Pearce, J. A., & Robbins, D. K. (1993). Toward improved 
theory and research on business turnaround. Journal of 
Management, 19(3), 613–636.

Pearson, A. W., Carr, J. C., & Shaw, J. C. (2008). Toward 
a theory of familiness: A social capital perspective. 
Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 32(6), 949–969.

Pérez-González, F. (2006). Inherited control and firm perfor-
mance. American Economic Review, 96(5), 1559–1588.

Peters, F. S., & Wagner, A. F. (2014). The executive turnover 
risk premium. The Journal of Finance, 69(4), 1529–1563.

Petriglieri, G., & Peshkam, A. (2022). Stranger leaders:  
A theory of marginal leaders’ conception of learning 
in organizations. Academy of Management Journal, 
1240–1273.

Petriglieri, G., & Petriglieri, J. L. (2010). Identity workspaces: 
The case of business schools. Academy of Management 
Learning & Education, 9(1), 44–60.

Petriglieri, G., Petriglieri, J. L., & Wood, J. D. (2018). Fast 
tracks and inner journeys: Crafting portable selves for 



32	 Family Business Review 38(1)

contemporary careers. Administrative Science Quarterly, 
63(3), 479–525.

Petriglieri, J. L. (2011). Under threat: Responses to and 
the consequences of threats to individuals’ identities. 
Academy of Management Review, 36(4), 641–662.

Petriglieri, J. L., & Devine, B. A. (2016). Mobilizing organi-
zational action against identity threats: The role of orga-
nizational members’ perceptions and responses. In M. 
G. Pratt, B. E. Ashforth, & D. Ravasi (Eds.), The Oxford 
handbook of organizational identity (pp. 239–255). 
Oxford University Press.

Pratt, M. G., Rockmann, K. W., & Kaufmann, J. B. (2006). 
Constructing professional identity: The role of work and 
identity learning cycles in the customization of iden-
tity among medical residents. Academy of Management 
Journal, 49(2), 235–262.

Schmitt, A., & Raisch, S. (2013). Corporate turnarounds: 
The duality of retrenchment and recovery. Journal of 
Management Studies, 50(7), 1216–1244.

Shamir, B., & Eilam, G. (2005). “What’s your story?” A life-
stories approach to authentic leadership development. The 
Leadership Quarterly, 16(3), 395–417.

Shamir, B., House, R. J., & Arthur, M. B. (1993). The moti-
vational effects of charismatic leadership: A self-concept 
based theory. Organization Science, 4(4), 577–594.

Shane, S. A. (2003). A general theory of entrepreneurship: 
The individual-opportunity nexus. Edward Elgar.

Simmel, G. (1895). The problem of sociology. The ANNALS 
of the American Academy of Political and Social Science, 
6(3), 52–63.

Smeekes, A., & Verkuyten, M. (2015). The presence of the 
past: Identity continuity and group dynamics. European 
Review of Social Psychology, 26(1), 162–202.

Sorenson, R. L., & Bierman, L. (2009). Family capital, fam-
ily business, and free enterprise. Family Business Review, 
22(3), 193–195.

Strauss, A. L. (1959). Mirrors and masks: The search for iden-
tity. Free Press.

Stryker, S. (1980). Symbolic interactionism: A social struc-
tural version. Benjamin/Cummings.

Stryker, S. (1987). Identity theory: Developments and exten-
sions. In K. M. Yardley & T. Honess (Eds.), Self and iden-
tity: Psychosocial perspectives (pp. 89–103). John Wiley 
& Sons.

Sundaramurthy, C., & Kreiner, G. E. (2008). Governing by man-
aging identity boundaries: The case of family businesses. 
Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 32(3), 415–436.

Tajfel, H. (1974). Social identity and intergroup behaviour. 
Social Science Information, 13(2), 65–93.

Tang, Y., Mack, D. Z., & Chen, G. (2018). The differential 
effects of CEO narcissism and hubris on corporate social 
responsibility. Strategic Management Journal, 39(5), 
1370–1387.

Thibaut, J. W., & Kelley, H. H. (1959). The social psychology 
of groups. John Wiley & Sons.

Thornborrow, T., & Brown, A. D. (2009). “Being regi-
mented”: Aspiration, discipline and identity work in the 
British parachute regiment. Organization Studies, 30(4), 
355–376.

Thornhill, S., & Amit, R. (2003). Learning about failure: 
Bankruptcy, firm age, and the resource-based view. 
Organization Science, 14(5), 497–509.

Toubiana, M. (2020). Once in orange always in orange? 
Identity paralysis and the enduring influence of institu-
tions on identity. Academy of Management Journal, 
63(3), 1739–1774.

Trahms, C. A., Ndofor, H. A., & Sirmon, D. G. (2013). 
Organizational decline and turnaround: A review and 
agenda for future research. Journal of Management, 
39(5), 1277–1307.

Uzzi, B. (1997). Social structure and competition in interfirm 
networks: The paradox of embeddedness. Administrative 
Science Quarterly, 42(1), 35–67.

Van Knippenberg, D. (2011). Embodying who we are: Leader 
group prototypicality and leadership effectiveness. The 
Leadership Quarterly, 22(6), 1078–1091.

Villalonga, B., & Amit, R. (2006). How do family ownership, 
control and management affect firm value? Journal of 
Financial Economics, 80(2), 385–417.

Vuolteenaho, T. (2002). What drives firm-level stock returns? 
The Journal of Finance, 57(1), 233–264.

Ward, J. L. (2004). Perpetuating the family business: 50 les-
sons learned from long-lasting, successful families in 
business. Palgrave Macmillan.

Weick, K. E. (1995). Sensemaking in organizations (3rd ed.). 
SAGE.

Wenzel, M., Stanske, S., & Lieberman, M. B. (2021). Strategic 
responses to crisis. Strategic Management Journal, 42(2), 
O16–O27.

White, H. (1980). A heteroskedasticity-consistent covariance 
matrix estimator and a direct test for heteroskedasticity. 
Econometrica, 48(4), 817–838.

Winn, J. (1997). Asset productivity turnaround: The growth/
efficiency challenge. Journal of Management Studies, 
34(4), 585–600.

Wolfolds, S. E., & Siegel, J. (2019). Misaccounting for endo-
geneity: The peril of relying on the Heckman two-step 
method without a valid instrument. Strategic Management 
Journal, 40(3), 432–462.

Wooldridge, J. M. (2002). Econometric analysis of cross sec-
tion and panel data. MIT Press.

Zahra, S. A. (2010). Harvesting family firms’ organiza-
tional social capital: A relational perspective. Journal of 
Management Studies, 47(2), 345–366.

Zellweger, T. M., Chrisman, J. J., Chua, J. H., & Steier, L. P. 
(2019). Social structures, social relationships, and family 
firms. Entrepreneurship Theory and Practice, 43(2), 207–
223.

Zhang, Y., & Rajagopalan, N. (2004). When the known  
devil is better than an unknown god: An empirical  



Ahrens et al.	 33

study of the antecedents and consequences of relay CEO 
successions. Academy of Management Journal, 47(4), 
483–500.

Zhu, D. H., & Chen, G. (2015). CEO narcissism and the 
impact of prior board experience on corporate strategy. 
Administrative Science Quarterly, 60(1), 31–65.

Author Biographies

Jan-Philipp Ahrens leads the interdisciplinary research group 
family firms at University of Mannheim, Germany; currently 
represents the chair of Future of Work, HR Management, & 
Organization at University of Duisburg-Essen, Germany; is a 
SCANCOR alumnus at Stanford University, USA; and teaches 
family business at the executive education level at Mannheim 
Business School, Germany.

Marc Kowalzick is an assistant professor at Rotterdam School 
of Management, Erasmus University, Netherlands. His 
research interests center around the field of strategic manage-
ment, with an emphasis on strategic leadership and corporate 

governance. In this field, he investigates when and how top 
executives affect organizational outcomes. As such, his work 
examines how the needs, values, and dispositions of organiza-
tional leaders shape (and are shaped by) their firms’ strategic 
actions, performance outcomes, and society at large.

Jochim G. Lauterbach acquired his PhD in 2018 at Technical 
University of Munich, Germany, focusing on stock market 
anomalies and the cross-section of stock returns. Additional 
research interests are corporate leader identity, as well as 
founder and family firm performance. After finishing his PhD, 
he joined the Italian bank UniCredit where he contributes as a 
Risk Modeling and Methodologies Senior Professional, while 
continuously pursuing academic research projects.

Jennifer Louise Petriglieri (Jennifer.Petriglieri@insead.edu) 
is an associate professor of organizational behavior at 
INSEAD, France. She takes a systems psychodynamic per-
spective to research leadership and identity in organizations in 
crisis, contemporary careers, and significant workplace 
relationships.

mailto:Jennifer.Petriglieri@insead.edu

